
TCEQ Interoffice Memorandum 

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 

TO:   Office of the Chief Clerk    
Texas Commission on Environmental Quality  

  
THRU:  Chris Kozlowski, Team Leader  

Water Rights Permitting Team  
  
FROM:  Jenna Rollins, Project Manager  

Water Rights Permitting Team  
  
DATE:  April 23, 2021 
  
SUBJECT:  A.D.D. Corp.  

ADJ 2179 
CN600718738, RN101295566 
Application No. 19-2179C to Amend Certificate of Adjudication No. 19- 

  2179 
 Texas Water Code § 11.122, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice 

San Antonio River, San Antonio River Basin   
Wilson and Karnes counties 

  
 
The application and fees were received on February 2, 2021. Additional information 
was received on April 7 and April 13, 2021, and fees were received on April 13, 
2021. The application was declared administratively complete and accepted for 
filing with the Office of the Chief Clerk on April 23, 2021. Mailed notice to the 
interjacent water right holders of record in the San Antonio River Basin is required 
pursuant to Title 30 TAC § 295.158(c)(3)(D). 
 
All fees have been paid and the application is sufficient for filing.  
  
  
  
_________________________  
Jenna Rollins, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
  
 

 

 

 

 

OCC Mailed Notice Required    □YES □NO 



Jon Niermann, Chairman 

Emily Lindley, Commissioner 

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Toby Baker, Executive Director 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service? tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

April 23, 2021 
    

Mr. Richard Ocker                                                                        VIA-EMAIL  
A.D.D. Corp.  
P.O. Box 2988 
Port Aransas, TX 78373 
  
RE: A.D.D. Corp.  

ADJ 19-2179 
CN600718738, RN101295566 
Application No. 19-2179C to Amend Certificate of Adjudication No. 19-2179 
Texas Water Code § 11.122, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice 
San Antonio River, San Antonio River Basin   
Wilson and Karnes counties 
  

Dear Mr. Ocker:  
 
This acknowledges receipt, on April 7 and April 13, 2021, of additional information and fees in 
the amount of $346.92 (Receipt No. M116626, copy attached).  
  
The application was declared administratively complete and filed with the Office of the Chief 
Clerk on April 23, 2021. Staff will continue processing the application for consideration by the 
Executive Director.   
  
Please be advised that additional information may be requested during the technical review 
phase of the application process.  
  
If you have any questions concerning the application, please contact me via email at 
jenna.rollins@tceq.texas.gov or by phone at 512-239-1845. 
  
 
Sincerely,  
  
   
 
Jenna Rollins, Project Manager   
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section  
  
Attachment 
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Jenna Rollins

From:
Sent: Tuesday, April 13, 2021 8:29 AM
To: Jenna Rollins
Subject: Fwd: DOC143.PDF
Attachments: DOC143.PDF

Jenna Rollins, Project Manager  
 
The following is submitted in response to your letter of March 26, 2021 concerning application 19-2179C. 
 
1.  Worksheet 5.0 has been completed and a copy is attached. 
2.  The request for temporary storage in reservoirs has been deleted. The Administrative Information Report page 2 has 
been revised accordingly,  and is attached. 
3.  Per our conversation, the diversion reach is for mining purposes.  All diversion points downstream of the applicant’s 
property will require landowner consent.  This consent will be submitted to the TCEQ.  This requirement will be a special 
condition of the permit amendment.   
4.  A check for fees of $346.92 has been mailed to TCEQ Cashiers Office at the address in the instructions.  A copy is 
attached.   
 
Please add these attached documents to the A.D.D. Corp. application and advise if any additional  information is needed. 
 
Thank you for your help, 
Richard Ocker  
A.D.D. Corp. 
 
 
 
Sent from my iPad 
 
Begin forwarded message: 

From:  
Date: April 9, 2021 at 1:52:41 PM CDT 
To: Gail <  
Subject: DOC143.PDF 

 

 
 
Sent from my iPad 
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Attached is a request for information letter for A.D.D. Corp., application 19-2179C. 
Please review and provide a response by April 26, 2021. 
  
Best regards, 
Jenna (Kieschnick) Rollins, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
512-239-1845 
  
<A.D.D. Corp_19-2179C_RFI_3.26.2021.pdf> 



Jon Niermann, Chairman 

Emily Lindley, Commissioner 

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Toby Baker, Executive Director 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service? tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

March 26, 2021

Mr. Richard Ocker  VIA-EMAIL 
A.D.D. Corp.
P.O. Box 2988
Port Aransas, TX 78373

RE: A.D.D. Corp.
ADJ 2179
CN600718738, RN101295566
Application No. 19-2179C to Amend Certificate of Adjudication No. 19-2179
Texas Water Code § 11.122, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice
San Antonio River, San Antonio River Basin
Wilson and Karnes counties

Dear Mr. Ocker: 

This acknowledges receipt, on February 2, 2021, of the referenced application and fees in the 
amount of $112.50 (Receipt No. M112277, copy attached). 

Additional information and fees are required before the application can be declared 
administratively complete.   

1. Complete Item 2 in Worksheet 5.0 Environmental Information.

2. Clarify if the reservoirs described in the application summary are on-channel or off-
channel. If the reservoirs are on-channel, provide a complete Worksheet 2.0 for each of
the reservoirs. If the reservoirs are off-channel, provide the capacity in acre-feet, and the
latitude and longitude for each of the reservoirs in decimal degrees, to at least six
decimal degree.

3. Provide recorded copies of legal documents establishing ownership of the land where
proposed diversion points within the diversion reach are located, or a copy of a duly
acknowledged written easement, consent, or license from the landowner(s) whose land
is associated with the proposed diversion points, pursuant Texas Administrative Code
(TAC) §295.10. A permit, if granted, will contain a special condition that would
authorize any diversion point within the diversion reach that is specified in a contract
where ownership or consent has been provided. The permit condition would also
require that these contracts be submitted to the TCEQ.



Mr. Richard Ocker 
Application No. 19-2179C 
March 26, 2021 
Page 2 of 2 

4. Remit fees in the amount of $346.92 as described below. Please make checks payable to
the TCEQ or Texas Commission on Environmental Quality.

Filing Fee (Amendment) $  100.00 
Recording Fee  $    12.50 
Notice Fee $  346.92 

   TOTAL FEES  $  459.42
FEES RECEIVED $  112.50 
BALANCE DUE  $  346.92 

Please provide the requested information and fees by April 26, 2021 or the application may be 
returned pursuant to 30 TAC § 281.18.  

If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me via email at 
jenna.rollins@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-1845.  

Sincerely, 

Jenna (Kieschnick) Rollins, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 

Attachment 
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Basis2 Receipt Report by Endorsement Number

Report_ID:

WUPAcct. #: WATER USE PERMITSAccount Name:

AMEND

Paid For

M112277

Endors. #

192179

Ref #2

ADD CORPORATION

Paid In By

CK

PayTyp

1220

Chk # Card#

BS00085697

Bank Slip

08-FEB-21

Tran.Date

 $112.50

Receipt Amnt.
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