
TCEQ Interoffice Memorandum 

 

 

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 
 

TO:             Office of the Chief Clerk       
  Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 
 
THRU:          Chris Kozlowski, Team Leader 
  Water Rights Permitting Team   
 
FROM:          Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager 
  Water Rights Permitting Team 
 
DATE:          January 17, 2025 
 
SUBJECT:     Blackfin Pipeline, LLC  

WRTP 14030  
CN606266211, RN112067772  
Application No. 14030 for a Temporary Water Use Permit  
Texas Water Code § 11.138, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice  
Brazos River, Brazos River Basin  
Austin and Waller Counties  

 
The application and partial fees were received on October 16, 2024. Additional 
information was received on December 17, 2024, and additional fees were received 
on January 9, 2025. The application was declared administratively complete and 
accepted for filing with the Office of the Chief Clerk on January 17,2025. Mailed 
notice to downstream water right holders of record in the Brazos River Basin is 
required pursuant to Title 30 Texas Administrative Code § 295.154. 
 
All fees have been paid and the application is sufficient for filing. 
 
 
 
____________________________ 
Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager  
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

OCC Mailed Notice Required    ☒YES  □NO 



Brooke T. Paup, Chairwoman  

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Catarina R. Gonzales, Commissioner 

Kelly Keel, Executive Director 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service?     tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

January 17, 2025 
 

     
Ms. Leslie Kelton, Senior Project Manager      VIA E-MAIL  
Blackfin Pipeline, LLC  
100 Congress Ave., Ste. 2200  
Austin, TX 78701-4072  
    
RE: Blackfin Pipeline, LLC  

WRTP 14030  
CN606266211, RN112067772  
Application No. 14030 for a Temporary Water Use Permit  
Texas Water Code § 11.138, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice  
Brazos River, Brazos River Basin  
Austin and Waller Counties  

    
Dear Ms. Kelton: 
 
This acknowledges receipt of additional information on December 17, 2024, and of fees in the 
amount of $69.53 (Receipt No. M550785, copy attached) on January 9, 2025. 
 
The application was declared administratively complete and filed with the Office of the Chief 
Clerk on January 17, 2025. Staff will continue processing the application for consideration by 
the Executive Director. 
 
Please be advised that additional information may be requested during the technical review 
phase of the application process. 
 
If you have any questions concerning the application, please contact me via email at 
Natalia.Ponebshek@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-4641. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
 
Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager  
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
 
Attachment 
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Natalia Ponebshek

From: Natalia Ponebshek
Sent: Friday, January 10, 2025 3:52 PM
To: Susan Fischer
Cc: Leslie Kelton; Chris Kozlowski; Humberto Galvan
Subject: RE: Blackfin Pipeline LLC, WRTP 14030, 14031, 14032 RFI

Good afternoon, 
 
We received the checks and information provided and are reviewing your response. 
 
Thank you, 
 
Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
(512) 239-4641 
 
From: Susan Fischer >  
Sent: Friday, January 10, 2025 12:28 PM 
To: Natalia Ponebshek <Natalia.Ponebshek@tceq.texas.gov> 
Cc: Leslie Kelton > 
Subject: RE: Blackfin Pipeline LLC, WRTP 14030, 14031, 14032 RFI 
 
Good afternoon Natalia, 
 
I just wanted to follow up on these RFIs and make sure you received the checks and the West Fork San Jacinto 
diversion location verification that we sent before the holiday break. And if there is anything else you need to 
complete your review please let me know. 
 
Thanks, 
Susan 
 
 

Susan Fischer 
Project Manager – Environmental 
 
SWCA Environmental Consultants 
10245 W. Little York, Suite 600 
Houston, Texas 77040 
D 346.388.1157 | M 512.659.7013 | F 281.617.3227 
 

 

 
 
 

 

 
 

From: Natalia Ponebshek <Natalia.Ponebshek@tceq.texas.gov>  
Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2024 12:48 PM 
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To: Susan Fischer > 
Cc: Chris Kozlowski <chris.kozlowski@tceq.texas.gov>; Humberto Galvan <Humberto.Galvan@tceq.texas.gov> 
Subject: Blackfin Pipeline LLC, WRTP 14030, 14031, 14032 RFI 
 
Susan, 
 
Confirmation of receipt. The attached documents were not included in the original submission.  
 
Thank you, 
 
Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
(512) 239-4641 
 
From: Susan Fischer   
Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2024 11:14 AM 
To: Natalia Ponebshek <Natalia.Ponebshek@tceq.texas.gov> 
Subject: RE: Phone issues 
 
No worries, I appreciate the eƯort! 
 
I am supporting Blackfin Pipeline, LLC with the water rights permitting, so I was following up on the three RFIs we 
just received. We are getting the checks drafted and double checking the diversion site at the West Fork San 
Jacinto, but I wanted to check on the “written evidence” item. I thought I had provided a power of attorney 
certification for Leslie Kelton (attached), so I just wanted to know if I forgot to include those for these submittals, 
or if those had been included and you were needing some other documentation.  
 
Thanks, 
Susan 
 
 

Susan Fischer 
Project Manager – Environmental 
 
SWCA Environmental Consultants 
10245 W. Little York, Suite 600 
Houston, Texas 77040 
D 346.388.1157 | M 512.659.7013 | F 281.617.3227 
 

 

 
 
 

 

 
 

From: Natalia Ponebshek <Natalia.Ponebshek@tceq.texas.gov>  
Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2024 10:29 AM 
To: Susan Fischer  
Subject: RE: Phone issues 
 
I will look into the issue further, but my phone does not appear to be working properly at this time. How 
can I help you?  
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Thank you, 
 
Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
(512) 239-4641 
 
From: Susan Fischer   
Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2024 10:19 AM 
To: Natalia Ponebshek <Natalia.Ponebshek@tceq.texas.gov> 
Subject: Phone issues 
 
Hello, 
 
I think we are trying to call each other right now, but I cannot hear anything when I answer. You can also try me on 
my cell below, but we can also just email if phone isn’t going to work. 
 

Susan Fischer 
Project Manager – Environmental 
 
SWCA Environmental Consultants 
10245 W. Little York, Suite 600 
Houston, Texas 77040 
D 346.388.1157 | M 512.659.7013 | F 281.617.3227 
 

 

 
 
 

 

 
 





1

Natalia Ponebshek

From: Susan Fischer <
Sent: Wednesday, December 18, 2024 12:06 PM
To: Natalia Ponebshek
Cc: Chris Kozlowski; Humberto Galvan; Leslie Kelton
Subject: RE: Blackfin Pipeline LLC, WRTP 14030, 14031, 14032 RFI

Hi Natalia, 
 
Thank you for the confirmation. I will get the checks sent out shortly, and regarding the Diversion Point 2 
coordinates for Application 14031, we are good with the TCEQ calculated coordinates you sent (Latitude 
30.269456 °N, Longitude 95.494583 °W).   
 
Thanks, 
Susan 
 
 

Susan Fischer 
Project Manager – Environmental 
 
SWCA Environmental Consultants 
10245 W. Little York, Suite 600 
Houston, Texas 77040 
D 346.388.1157 | M 512.659.7013 | F 281.617.3227 
 

 

 
 
 

 

 
 

From: Natalia Ponebshek <Natalia.Ponebshek@tceq.texas.gov>  
Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2024 12:48 PM 
To: Susan Fischer  
Cc: Chris Kozlowski <chris.kozlowski@tceq.texas.gov>; Humberto Galvan <Humberto.Galvan@tceq.texas.gov> 
Subject: Blackfin Pipeline LLC, WRTP 14030, 14031, 14032 RFI 
 
Susan, 
 
Confirmation of receipt. The attached documents were not included in the original submission.  
 
Thank you, 
 
Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
(512) 239-4641 
 
From: Susan Fischer   
Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2024 11:14 AM 
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To: Natalia Ponebshek <Natalia.Ponebshek@tceq.texas.gov> 
Subject: RE: Phone issues 
 
No worries, I appreciate the eƯort! 
 
I am supporting Blackfin Pipeline, LLC with the water rights permitting, so I was following up on the three RFIs we 
just received. We are getting the checks drafted and double checking the diversion site at the West Fork San 
Jacinto, but I wanted to check on the “written evidence” item. I thought I had provided a power of attorney 
certification for Leslie Kelton (attached), so I just wanted to know if I forgot to include those for these submittals, 
or if those had been included and you were needing some other documentation.  
 
Thanks, 
Susan 
 
 

Susan Fischer 
Project Manager – Environmental 
 
SWCA Environmental Consultants 
10245 W. Little York, Suite 600 
Houston, Texas 77040 
D 346.388.1157 | M 512.659.7013 | F 281.617.3227 
 

 

 
 
 

 

 
 

From: Natalia Ponebshek <Natalia.Ponebshek@tceq.texas.gov>  
Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2024 10:29 AM 
To: Susan Fischer  
Subject: RE: Phone issues 
 
I will look into the issue further, but my phone does not appear to be working properly at this time. How 
can I help you?  
 
Thank you, 
 
Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
(512) 239-4641 
 
From: Susan Fischer   
Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2024 10:19 AM 
To: Natalia Ponebshek <Natalia.Ponebshek@tceq.texas.gov> 
Subject: Phone issues 
 
Hello, 
 
I think we are trying to call each other right now, but I cannot hear anything when I answer. You can also try me on 
my cell below, but we can also just email if phone isn’t going to work. 
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Susan Fischer 
Project Manager – Environmental 
 
SWCA Environmental Consultants 
10245 W. Little York, Suite 600 
Houston, Texas 77040 
D 346.388.1157 | M 512.659.7013 | F 281.617.3227 
 

 

 
 
 

 

 
 



Delaware
The First State

Page 1

                  

7213310   8100 Authentication: 202688029
SR# 20230463931 Date: 02-10-23
You may verify this certificate online at corp.delaware.gov/authver.shtml

I, JEFFREY W. BULLOCK, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF 

DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT 

COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF FORMATION OF “BLACKFIN PIPELINE, 

LLC”, FILED IN THIS OFFICE ON THE TENTH DAY OF FEBRUARY, A.D. 

2023, AT 12:03 O`CLOCK P.M.    
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Natalia Ponebshek

From: Natalia Ponebshek
Sent: Monday, December 16, 2024 5:35 PM
To:
Cc: Chris Kozlowski; Humberto Galvan
Subject: Blackfin Pipeline LLC, WRTP 14030 RFI
Attachments: Blackfin_Pipeline_LLC_14030_RFI 1_Sent_12.16.2024.pdf

Good afternoon, 
  
Please find the attached request for information for the abovementioned application. A response is due 
by January 15, 2025. Please let me know if you have any questions regarding this request. 
  
Thank you, 
  
Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
(512) 239-4641 
 



Jon Niermann, Chairman 

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner  

Catarina R. Gonzales, Commissioner  

Kelly Keel, Executive Director  

 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service?     tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

December 16, 2024 
 

Ms. Leslie Kelton, Project Manager       VIA E-MAIL 
Blackfin Pipeline, LLC 
100 Congress Ave., Ste. 2200 
Austin, TX 78701-4072 
          
RE: Blackfin Pipeline, LLC 

WRTP 14030 
CN606266211, RN112067772 

 Application No. 14030 for a Temporary Water Use Permit 
Texas Water Code § 11.138, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice 
Brazos River, Brazos River Basin 

 Austin and Waller Counties 
 
Dear Ms. Kelton: 
 
This acknowledges receipt, on October 16, 2024, of the referenced application and fees in the 
amount of $251.25 (Receipt No. M541353, copy attached). 
 
The Brazos Watermaster Program previously granted a one-year temporary water use permit at 
the same location requested in the application. Therefore, staff can only issue a temporary 
permit for a maximum of two years pursuant to Texas Water Code § 11.138(d) which states that 
the Commission may not issue a temporary permit for a period exceeding three calendar years. 
 
Additional information and fees are required before the application can be declared 
administratively complete. 
 
1. Provide written evidence that Leslie Kelton is authorized to sign the application for Blackfin 

Pipeline, LLC, pursuant to Title 30 Texas Administrative Code (TAC) § 295.14(5) which 
states: 

 
If the applicant is a corporation, public district, county, municipality or other corporate 
entity, the application shall be signed by a duly authorized official. Written evidence in 
the form of by-laws, charters, or resolutions which specify the authority of the official to 
take such action shall be submitted. A corporation may file a corporate affidavit as 
evidence of the official’s authority to sign.  
 

2. Remit fees in the amount of $69.53 as described below. Please make check payable to the 
Texas Commission on Environmental Quality or the TCEQ. 

 
Filing Fee (WRTP > 10 acre-feet)     $ 250.00 
Recording Fee        $     1.25 
Use Fee ($1.00 per acre-foot x 46.03 acre-feet)   $   46.03 

      Notice Fee ($0.94 x 25 WR Holders)      $   23.50 
TOTAL FEES         $ 320.78 
FEES RECEIVED       $ 251.25 
TOTAL FEES DUE       $   69.53 

 



Ms. Leslie Kelton 
Application No. 14030 
December 16, 2024 
Page 2 of 2 

Please provide the requested information and fees by January 15, 2025 or the application may 
be returned pursuant to Title 30 TAC § 281.18. 

If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me via e-mail at 
Natalia.Ponebshek@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-4641. 

Sincerely, 

Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 

Attachment 



NOV-15-24 04:27 PM
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Basis2 Receipt Report by Endorsement Number

Report_ID:

EMGAcct. #: TEMPORARY/EMERGENCY WTR USE PERMIT ISSUEAccount Name:

TRINITY 

RIVER/TRINITY RIVER

BASIN

Paid For

M541353

Endors. # Ref #2

SWCA INC

Paid In By

CK

PayTyp

60122

Chk # Card#

BS00111413

Bank Slip

15-OCT-24

Tran.Date

 $251.25

Receipt Amnt.



TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
P.O. Box 13087 MC-160, Austin, Texas 78711-3087 

Telephone (512) 239-4600, FAX (512) 239-4770 

APPLICATION FOR A TEMPORARY WATER USE PERMIT FOR MORE THAN 10 ACRE-FEET OF WATER, AND/OR FOR A DIVERSION PERIOD 
LONGER THAN ONE CALENDAR YEAR 

This form is for an application for a temporary permit to divert water under Section 11.138, Texas Water Code. Any permit granted from this application 
may be suspended at any time by the applicable TCEQ Office if it is determined that surplus water is no longer available. 

Notice: This form will not be processed until all delinquent fees and/or penalties owed to the TCEQ or the Office of the Attorney Gen,eral on 
behalf of the TCEQ are paid in accordance with the Delinquent Fee and Penalty Protocol. 

1. 

2. 

Data on Applicant and Project: Social Security or Federal ID No. _______________ _ 

A. Name: Blackfin Pipeline, LLC
B. Mailing Address: 100 Congress Avenue, Suite 2200, Austin. Texas 78701
C. Telephone Number: (720) 556-2820 Fax Number: _________ E-mail Address  
D. Applicant owes fees or penalties? 0 Yes � No 

If yes, provide the amount and the nature of the fee or penalty as well as any identifying number: 

E. Describe Use of Water The water will be used for hydrostatic testing.
F. Description of Project (TOH Project No. if applicable) Installation of a new 48-inch-diameter natural gas pipeline. 
G. Highway Designation No. _____________ County Austin & Waller 
Type of Diversion (check one): 3. Rate of Diversion: 

:81 From Stream D From Reservoir A. Maximum ---�5�0�0�0 _________ gpm
(capacity of pump) 

4. Amount and Source of Water:

46.03 acre-feet of water within a period of three years (specify term period not to exceed a three year term). The water is to be obtained
from Brazos River, tributary of llitL_, tributary of .t::lffi__. tributary of WA__, Brazos River Basin.

5. Location of Diversion Point 1 (i.e., east bank/side diversion location): 

6. 

At Latitude 29. 897619 °N, Longitude -96.126171 •w, ((at) or (near) the stream crossing of), (at a reservoir in the vicinity of) HWY 529 
(R-O-W) (Highway), located in Zip Code �77�4�1=8 ___ , located 8.66 miles in a =so=u=t�he=a=s=t ____ direction from =B=el�lv=ill=e ____ _ 
(County Seat), Austin County, and located 14.04 miles in a south direction from Hempstead (County Seat), _W�a_ll�er _____ _ 
County, and =2.�1=0 ___ miles in a southeast direction from =B=ur"-'le=ig"'h.,__ __ , a nearby town shown on County road map. Note: 
Distance in straight line miles. 

Location of Diversion Point 2 (i.e., west bank/side diversion location): 

At Latitude 29.897390 °N, Longitude -96.126646 •w, ((at) or (near) the stream crossing of). (at a reservoir in the vicinity of) HWY 529 
(R-O-W) (Highway), located in Zip Code 77418 . located 8.63 miles in a southeast direction from Bellville (County Seat), 
�A=us�t�in�--County, and =-2,....1_,,_0 _______ miles in a southeast direction from Burleigh , a nearby town shown on County 
road map. Note: Distance in straight line miles. 

Enclose a USG$ 7.5 minute topographic map with the diversion point and/or the return water discharge points labeled. Owner's written 
consent is required for water used from any private reservoir, or private access to diversion point. 

Access to Diversion Point (check one): 

D Public right-of-way 
� Private property 

(A letter of permission from landowner is attached) 
0 Other (Explain) 

7. Fees Enclosed: 

Filing ........................... ............... . 
Recording ..................................... . 
Use ($1.00 per ac-ft or fraction thereof) 
(Note: 1 ac-ft = 325,851 gals. Total 

1 ac-ft = 7758.35 bbls.) 

1 O ac-ft 
or less 

$ 100.00 
$ 1.25 
s 

$ __ _ 

greater than 
1 O ac-ft 

$ 250.00 
$ 1.2f, 
$ __ 
$ __ 

Upon completion of any project for which a temporary water permit is granted, the Permittee is required by law to report the amount of water 
used. This document must be properly signed and duly notarized before it can by accepted or considered by the Texas Commission on 

:�:

H

� Uz\fl �ltiv1 
Name (print) 

Subscribed and sworn to me as bei ay of ootz>txr ' 2024 

Form TCEQ-10202 (revised 3/2010 

RECEIVED
OCT 1 6 2D24

Water Availability Divisio,



October 8, 2024 

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 
P.O. Box 13087 MC-160 
Austin, TX 78711-3087 
(512) 239-4600

Re: Request for Temporary Water Use Permit, Up to 46.03 Acre-Feet 

Blackfin Pipeline, LLC 

Blackfin Pipeline 

Austin and Waller Counties, Texas 

Dear Texas Commission on Environmental Quality: 

Blackfin Pipeline, LLC (Blackfin) requests permission to withdraw water from the Brazos River in Austin 
and Waller Counties, Texas to hydrostatically test the Blackfin Pipeline. Specifically, Blackfin proposes to 
withdraw up to 46.03 acre-feet (15,000,000 gallons) of water between the cast bank diversion (29.897619°, 
-96.126171 °) and west bank diversion (29.897390°, -96.126646°) to conduct hydrostatic testing of new
steel, 48-inch-diameter pipe, for a period of less than three years. Subsequent to completion of hydrostatic
testing, it is assumed that all diverted water will be returned to the Brazos River at the same locations.

Enclosed are a Texas Commission on Environmental Quality (TCEQ) Temporary Water Use Permit 
Application Form (TCEQ-10202), maps of the proposed diversion locations, environmental measures, 
copies of easement agreements, and payment check for TCEQ review and approval. 

Construction began on October 7, 2024, and based on the current project schedule, which is subject to 
change, estimates construction to be complete by December 31, 2025. Water withdrawal will be conducted 
during construction and is proposed for a one-time use over a 30-60 day duration. 

Should you have questions or require additional information/coordination please contact me at 720-556-
2820 (email at ). Following issuance of the permit, please e-mail me a copy of the 
pem1it. 

Sincerely, 

�� 
Leslie Kelton 
Senior Project Manager 
Blackfin Pipeline, LLC 

Attachments: Attachment 1 -TCEQ Form 10202, Attachment 2 - Maps, Attachment 3 - Environmental 

Measures, Attachment 4 -Copy of Easement Agreements, Attachment 5 -Payment Check 

RECEIVED
OCT 1 6 2D24

Water Availability Divisio,
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Basis2 Receipt Report by Endorsement Number

Report_ID:

EMGAcct. #: TEMPORARY/EMERGENCY WTR USE PERMIT ISSUEAccount Name:

TRINITY 

RIVER/TRINITY RIVER

BASIN

Paid For

M541353

Endors. # Ref #2

SWCA INC

Paid In By

CK

PayTyp

60122

Chk # Card#

BS00111413

Bank Slip

15-OCT-24

Tran.Date

 $251.25

Receipt Amnt.




