
TCEQ Interoffice Memorandum 

 

 

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 
 

TO:             Office of the Chief Clerk       
  Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 
 
THRU:          Chris Kozlowski, Team Leader 
  Water Rights Permitting Team   
 
FROM:          Hal E. Bailey, Jr., Project Manager 
  Water Rights Permitting Team 
 
DATE:          November 17, 2025 
 
SUBJECT:     Charles Book & Mary Book 
  ADJ 1349 

CN604336354, CN604788984, RN102741030 
Application No. 14-1349A to Amend Certificate of Adjudication  

No. 14-1349 
Texas Water Code § 11.122, Requiring Limited Notice 
Concho River, Colorado River Basin 
Tom Green County 
 

The application was received on August 21, 2025, and partial fees were received on 
August 22, 2025. Additional fees were received on September 29, 2025, and 
additional information was received on October 23 and October 24, 2025. The 
application was declared administratively complete and accepted for filing with the 
Office of the Chief Clerk on November 17, 2025. Notice to interjacent water right 
holders of record in the Concho River Basin is required pursuant to Title 30 Texas 
Administrative Code § 295.158(c)(3)(C). All fees have been paid and the 
application is sufficient for filing. 
 
 
 
____________________________ 
Hal E. Bailey, Jr., Project Manager  
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

OCC Mailed Notice Required    ☒YES  ☐NO 



Brooke T. Paup, Chairwoman 

Catarina R. Gonzales, Commissioner 

Tonya R. Miller, Commissioner 

Kelly Keel, Executive Director 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service? tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

 November 17, 2025 
   

Mr. Cory Book         VIA E-MAIL 
11094 E. Book Rd. 
Miles, TX 76861-4611 
 
RE: Charles Book and Mary Book 
 ADJ 1349 

CN604336354, CN604788984, RN102741030 
Application No. 14-1349A to Amend Certificate of Adjudication No. 14-1349 
Texas Water Code § 11.122, Requiring Limited Notice 
Concho River, Colorado River Basin 
Tom Green County 

 
Dear Mr. Book: 
 
This acknowledges receipt, on September 29, 2025, of additional fees in the amount of $1.88 
(Receipt No. M640600, copy attached) and of additional information on October 23 and October 
24, 2025. 
 
The application was declared administratively complete and filed with the Office of the Chief 
Clerk on November 17, 2025. Staff will continue processing the application for consideration by 
the Executive Director. 
 
Please be advised that additional information may be requested during the technical review 
phase of the application process. 
 
If you have any questions concerning the application, please contact me via email at 
hal.bailey@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-4615. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
 
Hal E. Bailey, Jr., Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
 
Attachment 









Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Lillian Beerman <Lillian.Beerman@tceq.texas.gov>
Date: October 23, 2025 at 11:09:45 AM CDT
To: 
Cc: Lillian Beerman <Lillian.Beerman@tceq.texas.gov>
Subject: Charles and Mary Book 14-1349A RFI Reminder

Mr. Cory Book,
We received your outstanding fees of $1.88.  We still await
confirmation of the coordinates of your diversion reach.  I have
attached the Request for Information for Charles Book and Mary
Book's Application No. 14-1349A.  Response is due COB tomorrow
Friday, October 24. 2025.
You may send your response via email.  Please do not hesitate to
contact me if you have any questions.
Thank You,

Lillian E. Beerman, Ph.D.

Water Rights Permitting Team

Water Availability Division

512-239-4019

lillian.beerman@tceq.texas.gov







Charles Book and Mary Book 
Application No. 14-1349A 
September 24, 2025 
Page 2 of 2 
 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service? tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

 
If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me via email at 
lillian.beerman@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-4019. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
 
Lillian E. Beerman, Ph.D., Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
 
Attachment 
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If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me via email at 
lillian.beerman@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-4019. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
 
Lillian E. Beerman, Ph.D., Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
 
Attachment 


































































































