
TCEQ Interoffice Memorandum 

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 

TO:             Office of the Chief Clerk   
Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 

THRU:          Chris Kozlowski, Team Leader 
Water Rights Permitting Team 

FROM:          Hal E. Bailey, Jr., Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 

DATE:  October 30, 2025 

SUBJECT:     Isaacs Brazos River Farm Partnership 
ADJ 4359 
CN606146215, RN105807077 
Application No. 12-4359B to Amend Certificate of Adjudication 

No. 12-4359 
Texas Water Code § 11.122, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice 
Brazos River, Brazos River Basin 
Falls and Robertson Counties 

The application was received on May 5, 2025, and partial fees were received on 
June 3, 2025. Additional information and fees were received on October 16 and 21, 
2025, respectively. The application was declared administratively complete and 
accepted for filing with the Office of the Chief Clerk on October 30, 2025. Notice to 
interjacent water right holders of record in the Brazos River Basin is required 
pursuant to Title 30 Texas Administrative Code (TAC) § 295.158(c)(3)(D).  

All fees have been paid and the application is sufficient for filing. 

____________________________ 
Hal E. Bailey, Jr., Project Manager  
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 

OCC Mailed Notice Required    ☒YES ☐NO



Brooke T. Paup, Chairwoman 

Catarina R. Gonzales, Commissioner 

Tonya R. Miller, Commissioner 

Kelly Keel, Executive Director 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service? tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

October 30, 2025 

Mr. Richard George, Environmental Consultant VIA E-MAIL 
Enviro-Ag Engineering Inc. 
9855 FM 847 
Dublin, TX 76446-7653 

RE: Isaacs Brazos River Farm Partnership 
ADJ 4359 
CN606146215, RN105807077 
Application No. 12-4359B to Amend Certificate of Adjudication No. 12-4359 
Texas Water Code § 11.122, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice 
Brazos River, Brazos River Basin 
Falls and Robertson Counties 

Dear Mr. George: 

This acknowledges receipt, on October 16, 2025, of additional information, and on October 21, 
2025, of additional fees in the amount of $5.88 (Receipt No. M641469B, copy attached). 

The application was declared administratively complete and filed with the Office of the Chief 
Clerk on October 30, 2025. Staff will continue processing the application for consideration by 
the Executive Director.  

Please be advised that additional information may be requested during the technical review 
phase of the application process. 

If you have any questions concerning the application, please contact me via email at 
hal.bailey@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-4615. 

Sincerely, 

Hal E. Bailey, Jr., Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 

Attachment 
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Hal Bailey

From: Richard George 
Sent: Thursday, October 16, 2025 11:39 AM
To: Hal Bailey
Cc: Humberto Galvan; Chris Kozlowski
Subject: RE: Isaacs Brazos River Farm Partnership Application No. 12-4359B Request for 

Information (RFI)
Attachments: BRFP RFI Response.pdf

Mr. Bailey, attached please find the response to the RFIs for App. No. 12-4358B & 12-4359B.  A hard copy 
is being mailed out today with the fee payment.   

Thank you, 
Richard 







1

Hal Bailey

From: Hal Bailey
Sent: Monday, October 6, 2025 3:21 PM
To: 'Richard George'
Cc: Humberto Galvan; Chris Kozlowski
Subject: RE: Isaacs Brazos River Farm Partnership Application No. 12-4359B Request for 

Information (RFI)
Attachments: Isaacs_Brazos_River_Farm_Partnership_12-4359B_RFI_Ext_Letter_10.06.2025.pdf

Good afternoon Richard, 
 
Your request for an extension until 10/20/2025 to provide a response to the RFI letter dated 09/05/2025 
has been approved. 
 
Thank you, 
 
Hal E. Bailey, Jr. 
Natural Resources Specialist IV 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
Phone: 512-239-4615 

 



Brooke T. Paup, Chairwoman 

Catarina R. Gonzales, Commissioner 

Tonya R. Miller, Commissioner 

Kelly Keel, Executive Director 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service? tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

October 6, 2025 
   

Mr. Richard George, Environmental Consultant     VIA E-MAIL  
Enviro-Ag Engineering Inc. 
9855 FM 847 
Dublin, TX 76446-7653 
 
RE: Isaacs Brazos River Farm Partnership 

ADJ 4359 
CN606146215, RN105807077 
Application No. 12-4359B to Amend Certificate of Adjudication No. 12-4359 
Texas Water Code § 11.122, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice 
Brazos River, Brazos River Basin 

 Falls and Robertson Counties 
  
Dear Mr. George: 
  
This acknowledges receipt, on October 3, 2025, of the applicant’s request for an extension of 
time until October 20, 2025, to respond to the Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 
request for information letter dated September 5, 2025.   
       
The extension request is granted until October 20, 2025, and after that date the application 
may be returned pursuant to Title 30 Texas Administrative Code § 281.18. No further 
extensions will be granted associated with this request for information. 
 
If you have any questions concerning the application, please contact Hal Bailey, Jr. via e-mail at 
hal.bailey@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-4615. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
 
Bert Galvan, Manager  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section  
Water Availability Division 
 
BG/hb 
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Hal Bailey

From: Richard George 
Sent: Friday, October 3, 2025 8:20 AM
To: Hal Bailey
Cc: Humberto Galvan; Chris Kozlowski
Subject: RE: Isaacs Brazos River Farm Partnership Application No. 12-4359B Request for 

Information (RFI)

Mr. Bailey, we need to request a two-week deadline extension to respond to the RFI for COA 12-4359.  I 
am waiting on the check for the additional fees to submit for this and COA 12-4358.  The current deadline 
is October 6, 2025, the proposed two-week deadline extension would make the new deadline October 
20th, 2025.   
  
Thank you, 
Richard 
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Hal Bailey

From: Hal Bailey
Sent: Friday, September 5, 2025 11:53 AM
To: Richard George
Cc: Humberto Galvan; Chris Kozlowski
Subject: Isaacs Brazos River Farm Partnership Application No. 12-4359B Request for Information 

(RFI)
Attachments: Isaacs_Brazos_Farm_Partnership_12-4359B_RFI_09.05.2025.pdf

Good morning Richard, 
 
Please find the attached RFI for application no. 12-4359B.  Response due date is 10/06/2025. 
 
If you have any questions, please feel free to contact me. 
 
Thank you, 
 
Hal E. Bailey, Jr. 
Natural Resources Specialist IV 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
Phone: 512-239-4615 
 



Brooke T. Paup, Chairwoman 

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Catarina R. Gonzales, Commissioner 

Kelly Keel, Executive Director 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service? tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

September 5, 2025 
   

Mr. Richard George, Environmental Consultant     VIA E-MAIL  
Enviro-Ag Engineering Inc. 
9855 FM 847 
Dublin, TX 76446-7653 
 
RE: Isaacs Brazos River Farm Partnership 

ADJ 4359 
CN606146215, RN105807077 
Application No. 12-4359B to Amend Certificate of Adjudication No. 12-4359 
Texas Water Code § 11.122, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice 
Brazos River, Brazos River Basin 

 Falls and Robertson Counties 
  
Dear Mr. George: 
  
This acknowledges receipt, on May 5, 2025, of the referenced application, and on June 3, 2025, 
of partial fees in the amount of $112.50 (Receipt No. M558073A, copy attached). 
 
Additional information and fees are required before the application can be declared 
administratively complete. 
   
1. Confirm that the applicant is requesting to change the place of use to two tracts totaling 

2,102.76 acres of land in Falls and Robertson counties and is requesting that the additional 
land to be irrigated not be appurtenant to the Certificate.  
 
Staff notes the 495 acres of land currently authorized to be irrigated under Certificate of 
Adjudication No. 12-4359 are part of the tract requested as the new place of use in Falls and 
Robertson counties. If the applicant confirms the request above, this tract will no longer be 
appurtenant to the Certificate.  
 

2. Confirm that the downstream limit of Diversion Reach No. 2 is located in Robertson County 
and provide the survey and abstract numbers for the diversion point location. 

 
3. Remit fees in the amount of $5.88 as described below. Please make checks payable to the 

TCEQ or Texas Commission on Environmental Quality. 
 

Filing Fee (Amendment) 
Recording Fee  

$   100.00 
$     12.50 

Notice Fee ($2.94 x 2 WR Holders) $       5.88 
Total Fees $   118.38 
Fees Received $   112.50 
Fees Due $       5.88 

          
 



Isaacs Brazos River Farm Partnership 
Application No. 12-4359B 
September 5, 2025 
Page 2 of 2 
 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service? tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

Please provide the requested information and fees by October 6, 2025, or the application may 
be returned pursuant to Title 30 Texas Administrative Code § 281.18.  
 
If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me via email at 
hal.bailey@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-4615. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
 
Hal E. Bailey, Jr., Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
 
Attachment 
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TCEQ - A/R RECEIPT REPORT BY ACCOUNT NUMBER 

TCEQ 03-JUN-25 03:54 PM

Fee Description 

WTR USE PERMITS 

Fee Code 

Account# 

Account Name 

WUP 

WUP 

Ref#l 

Ref#2 

Paid In Bl:'. 

M558073A 

4539 

WATER USE PERMITS ENVIRO AG 

WUP 

WUP 

ENGINEERING 

INC 

M558073B 

4538 

WATER USE PERMITS ENVIRO AG 

ENGINEERING 

INC 

RECEIVED 
JUN O 6 2025 ti•

Water Availability Divisior 

Check Number CC Type 

Card Auth. Tran Code sli12 Kel:'. 

User D�ta Rec Code Document# 

16896 BS00115641 

060325 N D5803000 

RHDAVIS CK 

16896 BS00115641 

060325 N D5803000 

RHDAVIS CK 

Total (Fee Code): 

Grand Total: 

Tran Date Tran Amount 

03-JUN-25 -$112.50 

03-JUN-25 -$112.50 

-$225.00 

-$11,150.83 
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