
TCEQ Interoffice Memorandum 

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 

TO:       Office of the Chief Clerk   
Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 

THRU:  

FROM: 

DATE: 

Chris Kozlowski, Team Leader 
Water Rights Permitting Team 

Hal E. Bailey, Jr., Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 

November 7, 2022 

SUBJECT: JMRS Partners, Ltd. 
ADJ 2149 
CN606048874, RN102122637 
Application No. 19-2149A to Amend Certificate of Adjudication 
    No. 19-2149 
Texas Water Code § 11.122, Not Requiring Notice 
Leon Creek, San Antonio River Basin  
Bexar County  

The application was received on October 10, 2022. Application fees were received 
on October 20, 2022, and additional information was received on October 28 and 
31, 2022. The application was declared administratively complete and accepted for 
filing with the Office of the Chief Clerk on November 7, 2022. No notice is required 
pursuant to House Bill 1964 and 30 Texas Administrative Code (TAC) §§ 
295.158(c)(2)(A) and 295.158(c)(2)(B). 

All fees have been paid and the application is sufficient for filing. 

___________________________ 
Hal E. Bailey, Jr., Project Manager  
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 

OCC Mailed Notice Required   □YES □NO



Jon Niermann, Chairman 

Emily Lindley, Commissioner 

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Toby Baker, Executive Director 

How is our customer service?     tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

November 7, 2022 

Mr. Devin “Buck” Benson VIA E-MAIL
Barton Benson Jones PLLC. 
745 E. Mulberry Ave., Suite 550 
San Antonio, Texas 78212 

RE: JMRS Partners, Ltd. 
ADJ 2149 
CN606048874, RN102122637 
Application No. 19-2149A to Amend Certificate of Adjudication No. 19-2149 
Texas Water Code § 11.122, Not Requiring Notice 
Leon Creek, San Antonio River Basin  
Bexar County  

Dear Mr. Benson: 

This acknowledges receipt, on October 28 and 31, 2022, of additional information. 

The application was declared administratively complete and filed with the Office of the Chief 
Clerk on November 7, 2022. Staff will continue processing the application for consideration by 
the Executive Director. 

If you have any questions concerning the application, please contact me via email at 
hal.bailey@tceq.texas.gov or at (512) 239-4615. 

Sincerely, 

Hal E. Bailey, Jr., Project Manager  
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 
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Hal Bailey

From: Buck Benson 
Sent: Monday, October 31, 2022 10:04 AM
To: Hal Bailey
Subject: FW: JMRS Partners, Ltd. Application No. 19-2149A Deeds
Attachments: SKM_C65822103021570.pdf

Hal 
 
My apologies – the parcels (parcel #1091760 for 13.53 acres and parcel #1112998 for 17.1863 acres)  should not have 
been included.  I have added up what’s in the deeds and what is BCAD.  See attached.  Could we just use the 368.704 
acres?   
 

  
 

DEVIN “BUCK” BENSON 
Member | Barton Benson Jones PLLC 
 
Office: (210) 610-5335 
Direct: (210) 640-9146 
 

From: Hal Bailey <Hal.Bailey@tceq.texas.gov>  
Sent: Monday, October 31, 2022 9:25 AM 
To: Buck Benson < > 
Subject: JMRS Partners, Ltd. Application No. 19-2149A Deeds 
 
Good morning Buck, 
 
It doesn’t appear that the deeds submitted with the application cover the increased acreage you referenced in the RFI 
response. 
I have tried several times, but I can’t get the acreage to add up to 394.94 to match the map you submitted.  Also, when I 
compared 
the map to the Bexar CAD, it shows that 2 of the parcels (parcel #1091760 for 13.53 acres and parcel #1112998) are not 
owned by 
JMRS Partners, Ltd.  Has the applicant recently acquired that land?  I may be missing something.  Can you please 
assist?  I’m trying to 
avoid having to send you another RFI. 
 
Thank you, 
 
Hal E. Bailey, Jr. 
Natural Resources Specialist III 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Availability Division 
Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 
512-239-4615  Hal.Bailey@tceq.texas.gov  
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Hal Bailey

From: Buck Benson < >
Sent: Friday, October 28, 2022 1:43 PM
To: Hal Bailey
Subject: RE: JMRS Partners, Ltd. Application No. 19-2149A RFI

The 394.94 acres includes the 15.3 acres 
 

  
 

DEVIN “BUCK” BENSON 
Member | Barton Benson Jones PLLC 
 
Office: (210) 610-5335 
Direct: (210) 640-9146 
 

From: Hal Bailey <Hal.Bailey@tceq.texas.gov>  
Sent: Friday, October 28, 2022 1:41 PM 
To: Buck Benson < > 
Subject: RE: JMRS Partners, Ltd. Application No. 19-2149A RFI 
 
Good afternoon Buck, 
 
Does the 394.94 acres include the 15.3 acres they are currently authorized for, or is that the additional acreage? 
 
Thank you, 
 
Hal E. Bailey, Jr. 
Natural Resources Specialist III 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Availability Division 
Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 
512-239-4615  Hal.Bailey@tceq.texas.gov  
 

From: Buck Benson < >  
Sent: Friday, October 28, 2022 1:30 PM 
To: Hal Bailey <Hal.Bailey@tceq.texas.gov> 
Cc: Chris Kozlowski <chris.kozlowski@tceq.texas.gov> 
Subject: RE: JMRS Partners, Ltd. Application No. 19-2149A RFI 
 
Good afternoon Hal 
 
Please see the attached responses.  I went back and looked at the acreage I original identified and where the operation 
currently resides.  I believe I missed some parcels and think I should probably amend the place of use to 394.94 acres.  I 
think that is bigger than what will actually be used but I would rather cover more than less.    
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DEVIN “BUCK” BENSON 
Member | Barton Benson Jones PLLC 
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Office: (210) 610-5335 
Direct: (210) 640-9146 
 

From: Hal Bailey <Hal.Bailey@tceq.texas.gov>  
Sent: Wednesday, October 26, 2022 3:25 PM 
To: Buck Benson < > 
Cc: Chris Kozlowski <chris.kozlowski@tceq.texas.gov> 
Subject: JMRS Partners, Ltd. Application No. 19-2149A RFI 
 
Good afternoon Mr. Benson, 
 
Attached is a Request for Information (RFI) letter for application no. 12-2149A. 
  
Please provide the requested additional information by COB on 11/28/2022. 
  
Should you have any questions, please let me know. 
  
Thank you, 
 
Hal E. Bailey, Jr. 
Natural Resources Specialist III 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Availability Division 
Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 
512-239-4615  Hal.Bailey@tceq.texas.gov  
 





 

 

Reponses to TCEQ RFI for application  

 

 

RESPONSE 

The meter that will be installed will have an accuracy of plus or minus 5.0%.   

 

 

RESPONSE 

The applicant will be utilizing an aggregate material washer to assist in washing the material to 
help recycle the maximum amount of water.    

 

 

RESPONSE 

The applicant will utilize two settling ponds to assist in recycling the maximum amount of water.  
Applicant will also preform routine inspections of the recycling system to ensure there are no 
leaks and that it is operating properly.  

 

RESPONSE 

The proposed place of us should be 394.94 acres.   
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Hal Bailey

From: Hal Bailey
Sent: Wednesday, October 26, 2022 3:25 PM
To:
Cc: Chris Kozlowski
Subject: JMRS Partners, Ltd. Application No. 19-2149A RFI
Attachments: JMRS_Partners_Ltd._19-2149A_RFI_Sent_10.26.2022.pdf

Good afternoon Mr. Benson, 
 
Attached is a Request for Information (RFI) letter for application no. 12-2149A. 
  
Please provide the requested additional information by COB on 11/28/2022. 
  
Should you have any questions, please let me know. 
  
Thank you, 
 
Hal E. Bailey, Jr. 
Natural Resources Specialist III 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Availability Division 
Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 
512-239-4615  Hal.Bailey@tceq.texas.gov  
 



 

Jon Niermann, Chairman 

Emily Lindley, Commissioner 

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Toby Baker, Executive Director  

 TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service?     tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

October 26, 2022 
 
Mr. Devin “Buck” Benson                                                     VIA E-MAIL  
Barton Benson Jones PLLC. 
745 E. Mulberry Ave., Suite 550 
San Antonio, Texas 78212 
 
RE: JMRS Partners, Ltd. 
 ADJ 2149 

CN606048874, RN102122637 
 Application No. 19-2149A to Amend Certificate of Adjudication No. 19-2149 
 Texas Water Code § 11.122, Not Requiring Notice 

Leon Creek, San Antonio River Basin  
 Bexar County  
 
Dear Mr. Benson: 
 
This acknowledges receipt, on October 10, and 20, 2022, of the referenced application and fees 
in the amount of $112.50 (Receipt No. M301730, copy attached).   
 
Additional information is required before the application can be declared administratively 
complete. 
 
1. Provide additional information concerning the submitted water conservation plan for 

industrial use to comply with Title 30 Texas Administrative Code (TAC) § 288.3.  
 

a. Confirm that the method(s) and/or device(s) used to measure and account for the 
amount of water diverted from the source of supply, described in Section II. B.3. of 
the water conservation plan (TCEQ-20839, Page number 5), is within an accuracy of 
plus or minus 5.0%. Staff recognizes that this section of the water conservation plan 
indicates a meter will be used; however, information about the meter’s accuracy is 
not included in this section. 
 

b. Describe the application of state-of-the-art equipment and/or process modifications 
to improve water use efficiency  as described in Section II. B.5. of the water 
conservation plan (TCEQ-20839, Page number 5). If this is not applicable, include an 
explanation of why the requirement is not applicable. 
 

c. Describe any other water conservation practices, methods, or techniques which the 
user shows to be appropriate for achieving the stated goal or goals of the water 
conservation plan as described in Section II. B.6. of the water conservation plan 
(TCEQ-20839, Page number 5). If not applicable, include an explanation of why the 
requirement is not applicable. 

 
2. Confirm the proposed place of use is 187.5 acres in Bexar County. Staff notes Page 2 of the 

Administrative Information Report states the applicant is requesting to add 172 acres to the 
existing 15.3 acres, resulting in a total of 187.3 acres. 
 



Mr. Devin “Buck” Benson  
Application No. 19-2149A 
October 26, 2022 
Page 2 of 2 

 
 

Please provide the requested information by November 28, 2022, or the application may be 
returned pursuant to Title 30 TAC § 281.18. 
 
Be aware that the amendment request to add uses to Certificate of Adjudication No. 19-2149 
may result in annual Water Use Assessment Fees (WUF). For more detailed information on these 
fees, see the attached Water Use Assessment Fee (WUF): Frequently Asked Questions fact sheet or 
contact the Water Quality Monitoring & Assessment Section at (512) 239-3838. 
 
If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me via email at 
hal.bailey@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-4615. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
 
Hal E. Bailey, Jr., Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
 
Attachments 





Water Use Assessment Fee (WUF) 
Frequently Asked Questions 

What Is This Fee? 

The Water Use Assessment Fee is a fee that is assessed annually on applicable water rights 
permits. Texas Water Code, §26.0135 & 26.0291 authorizes the TCEQ to establish fees to 
recover the reasonable costs of water quality assessment programs from wastewater and 
water right permit holders. TCEQ rules, Title 30 Texas Administrative Code (TAC), §21.1- 
21.4, set out the methodology for assessing water use fees, described below. 

 
Why are you billed? 

If you hold a water right and do not fall under an exemption, then you are subject to the 
Water Use Assessment Fee. Unless the water right is amended to fall under an exemption, 
you will be billed for this water right on an annual basis. 

 
Amendments can also make a water right that was not previously billed now billable. If you 
have not been billed in the past but are now receiving a WUF invoice, this is most likely 
because your water right has been amended and is now considered billable. 

 
If the water under your water right is being sold to a wastewater treatment plant that pays 
the Consolidated Water Quality Fee, and you can provide proof of these sales, please contact 
us using the information at the end of this document. 

 
What are reasons for exemption? 

Exemptions are listed in 30 TAC, § 21.3(c). Exemptions from the Water Use Assessment Fee 
include: municipal or industrial water rights directly associated with a facility that is 
assessed a Consolidated Water Quality Fee; agriculture (irrigation) water rights; non- 
priority hydroelectric water rights for a facility with a capacity of less than 2 megawatts; 
consumptive authorization less than 250 acre-feet; and non-consumptive authorization less 
than 2,500 acre-feet. 

 
How Is the Fee Assessed? 

Fees are based on the authorized annual use, not actual use. The total fee is the sum of the 
separate fees for each authorized water use in each of the following categories for each 
permit. 

 
The fee rate of $0.385 per acre-foot per year applies to authorized consumptive use 
(municipal, industrial, or mining purposes) if the specified limit is more than 250 acre-feet 
per year. 

 
The fee rate of $0.021 per acre-foot per year applies to authorized non-consumptive use 
(including hydroelectric and some recreation) if the specified limit is more than 2,500 acre- 
feet per year. 

 
The maximum water use fee for a single permit is $127,770, which may be adjusted annually 
using the latest Consumer Price Index. 

How are Diversion Amounts Distributed Among Uses? 

For permits with multiple uses that do not specify the amount per use, the total authorized 
amount is divided equally among all uses. 



Example: 10,000 ac-ft for irrigation, municipal, industrial, and mining 
10,000/4 = 2,500 ac-ft per use 
Irrigation is exempt; municipal not billed because wastewater treatment plant 
that uses the water pays the Consolidated Water Quality Fee; industrial billed 
$962.50 for 2,500 ac-ft; mining billed $962.50 for 2,500 ac-ft. 

 
Why do I have Multiple Invoice Numbers? 

Multiple invoice numbers are generated when the water right has multiple uses such as 
municipal (code 1), industrial (code 2), and mining (code 4). The bill is divided by use for 
accounting purposes. 

 
What If I Have More Than One Account? 

You may send all your payments in one envelope, but please enclose a separate check for 
each coupon. Do not send a check for the total amount. If the number of checks does not 
equal the number of coupons, the agency will be unable to determine which accounts to 
credit. Also, TCEQ will not be able to process your transactions by the automated process, 
and your account may not be credited in time to avoid late fees. 

 
Where Do I Get More Information? 

For copies of the fee rules (30 TAC, §21.1-21.4), refer to the TCEQ rules from the Texas 
Administrative Code on the Secretary of State’s web site at www.sos.state.tx.us. To learn 
more about the fee, please visit: 

https://www.tceq.texas.gov/agency/financial/fees/water-related-fees 
 

For billing and account balance information, call the TCEQ’s Financial Administration 
Division, Revenue Section at (512) 239-0369. 

 
If you have any questions about the Water Use Assessment Fee or the rates for your water 
right, contact the Water Quality Monitoring & Assessment Section at (512) 239-3838, or via 
email at wateruse@tceq.texas.gov, or write to: 

 
Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 
Water Quality Monitoring & Assessment, MC 234 
Water Use Fees 
P.O. Box 13087 
Austin, TX 78711-3087 
















































































































































































