
TCEQ Interoffice Memorandum 

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 

TO:   Office of the Chief Clerk    
Texas Commission on Environmental Quality  

  
THRU:  Chris Kozlowski, Team Leader  

Water Rights Permitting Team  
  
FROM:  Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager  

Water Rights Permitting Team  
  
DATE:  September 26, 2025 
  
SUBJECT:    Antoinette Kalala, Duane Lyssy, Maxine F. Lyssy, Sheldon Lyssy, and 

Wendy L. Volner   
ADJ 2182  
CN606008894, CN606008936, CN606008910, CN606008944, 

CN606008928, RN102640299  
Application No. 19-2182D to Amend Certificate of Adjudication  

No. 19-2182  
Texas Water Code § 11.122, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice  
San Antonio River, San Antonio River Basin  
Wilson and Karnes Counties  

  
The application was received on January 29, 2025 and partial fees were received on 
February 21, 2025. Additional information was received on August 29, 2025 and 
additional fees were received on September 12, 2025. The application was declared 
administratively complete and accepted for filing with the Office of the Chief Clerk 
on September 26, 2025. Mailed notice to the interjacent water right holders of 
record in the San Antonio River Basin is required pursuant to Title 30 Texas 
Administrative Code § 295.158(c)(3)(D). 
 
All fees have been paid and the application is sufficient for filing.  
  
  
  
_________________________  
Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
  
 

 

 

 

OCC Mailed Notice Required    □YES □NO 



Brooke T. Paup, Chairwoman  

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Catarina R. Gonzales, Commissioner 

Kelly Keel, Executive Director 

 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service? tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

September 26, 2025 
    

Mr. Michael Hartmann         VIA E-MAIL  
680 County Road 312  
Floresville, TX 78114-3407  
  
RE: Antoinette Kalala, Duane Lyssy, Maxine F. Lyssy, Sheldon Lyssy, and Wendy L. Volner   

ADJ 2182  
CN606008894, CN606008936, CN606008910, CN606008944, CN606008928, 

RN102640299  
Application No. 19-2182D to Amend Certificate of Adjudication No. 19-2182  
Texas Water Code § 11.122, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice  
San Antonio River, San Antonio River Basin  
Wilson and Karnes Counties  

 
Dear Mr. Hartmann: 
 
This acknowledges receipt, on August 29, 2025, of additional information, and on September 
12, 2025, of fees in the amount of $119.38 (Receipt No. M640243, copy attached).  
  
The application was declared administratively complete and filed with the Office of the Chief 
Clerk on September 26, 2025. Staff will continue processing the application for consideration 
by the Executive Director.   
 
Please be advised that additional information may be requested during the technical review 
phase of the application process. 
   
If you have any questions concerning the application, please contact me via email at 
Natalia.Ponebshek@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-4641. 
  
Sincerely,  
  
   
 
Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager   
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section  
 
Attachment 
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Natalia Ponebshek

From: Michael Hartmann 
Sent: Friday, August 29, 2025 9:51 AM
To: Natalia Ponebshek
Subject: Re: Kalala, Lyssy, Volner App No. 19-2128D RFI

In response to this Additional Information request: 
 
1. State and Regional water plans generally do not address every possible change in individual water 
rights. This application is consistent with the 2021 Regional Water Plan and the 2022 State Water Plan 
because there is nothing in the plans that conflict with the application.                                    
 
2. Applicants are not requesting to change the place of use for agricultural purposes. 
 
3. Payment of $119.38 has been mailed for additional Administration and Notice fees. 
 
On Tue, Jun 24, 2025 at 4:03 PM Natalia Ponebshek <Natalia.Ponebshek@tceq.texas.gov> wrote: 
Good afternoon, 
  
Please find the attached request for information for the abovementioned application. A response is due 
by July 24, 2025. Please let me know if you have any questions regarding this request. 
  
Thank you, 
  
Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
(512) 239-4641 
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Natalia Ponebshek

From: Michael Hartmann 
Sent: Tuesday, August 26, 2025 8:28 AM
To: Natalia Ponebshek
Subject: Re: Kalala, Lyssy, Volner App No. 19-2128D RFI Extension

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Good morning Natalia,  
  I apologize, I have not responded to the information request for the Kalla/Lyssy amendment application. 
I would really appreciate another extension on this, it could be short. I will get the information to you by 
the end of the week.   
 
On Fri, Aug 1, 2025 at 1:11 PM Natalia Ponebshek <Natalia.Ponebshek@tceq.texas.gov> wrote: 
Good afternoon, 
  
Please find the attached extension letter for the request for information for the abovementioned 
application. A response is due by August 25, 2025.  
  
Thank you, 
  
Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
(512) 239-4641 
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Natalia Ponebshek

From: Natalia Ponebshek
Sent: Friday, August 1, 2025 1:11 PM
To: Michael Hartmann
Cc: Chris Kozlowski; Humberto Galvan
Subject: Kalala, Lyssy, Volner App No. 19-2128D RFI Extension
Attachments: Kalala_Lyssy_Volner_19-2182D_RFI 1_Extension_Letter_Sent_8.1.2025.pdf

Good afternoon, 
  
Please find the attached extension letter for the request for information for the abovementioned 
application. A response is due by August 25, 2025.  
  
Thank you, 
  
Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
(512) 239-4641 
 



Jon Niermann, Chairman 

Emily Lindley, Commissioner 

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Kelly Keel, Interim Executive Director 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service?     tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

August 1, 2025 

Mr. Michael Hartmann  VIA E-MAIL 
Authorized Agent  
680 County Road 312  
Floresville, TX 78114-3407 

RE: Antoinette Kalala, Duane Lyssy, Maxine F. Lyssy, Sheldon Lyssy, and Wendy L. Volner 
ADJ 2182  
CN606008894, CN606008936, CN606008910, CN606008944, CN606008928, 

RN102640299  
Application No. 19-2182D to Amend Certificate of Adjudication No. 19-2182 
Texas Water Code (TWC) § 11.122, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice  
San Antonio River, San Antonio River Basin  
Wilson and Karnes Counties  

Dear Mr. Hartmann: 

This acknowledges receipt, on July 30, 2025, of the applicant’s request for an extension of time 
to respond to the Texas Commission on Environmental Quality’s request for information, dated 
June 24, 2025 (copy attached).  

An extension is granted until August 25, 2025, and after that date the application may be 
returned pursuant to Title 30 Texas Administrative Code § 281.18.   

If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact Ms. Natalia Ponebshek via e-
mail at Natalia.Ponebshek@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-4641.  

Sincerely, 

Bert Galvan, Section Manager 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
Water Availability Division 

BG/np 

Attachment 



Brooke T. Paup, Chairwoman  

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Catarina R. Gonzales, Commissioner 

Kelly Keel, Executive Director 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service?     tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

June 24, 2025 
 
Mr. Michael Hartmann   VIA E-MAIL 
Authorized Agent 
680 County Road 312 
Floresville, TX 78114-3407 
 
RE: Antoinette Kalala, Duane Lyssy, Maxine F. Lyssy, Sheldon Lyssy, and Wendy L. Volner  

ADJ 2182 
CN606008894, CN606008936, CN606008910, CN606008944, CN606008928, 

RN102640299 
 Application No. 19-2182D to Amend Certificate of Adjudication No. 19-2182 

Texas Water Code (TWC) § 11.122, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice 
San Antonio River, San Antonio River Basin 

 Wilson and Karnes Counties 
 
Dear Mr. Hartmann: 
 
This acknowledges receipt, on January 29, 2025, of the referenced application, and on February 
21, 2025, of fees in the amount of $112.50 (Receipt No. M554269, attached). 
 
Additional information and fees are required before the application can be declared 
administratively complete. 
 
1. Provide information describing how this application addresses a water supply need in a 

manner that is consistent with the state water plan or the applicable approved regional 
water plan (Section 4.a. of the Technical Information Report). Note: For examples, see page 
15 of the Instructions for Completing the Water Right Permitting Application (Form TCEQ-
10214A-inst). 
 

2. Confirm applicants are not requesting to change the place of use for agricultural purposes.  
Staff notes, the current place of use for agricultural purposes is to irrigate within a 37-acre 
tract and being part of a larger 359-acre tract in the Luis Manchaca Grant Survey, Abstract 
No. 18 in Wilson County.  
 
Alternatively, indicate the total acres of land the applicants propose to be irrigated and 
provide a recorded copy of the deed(s) for the property where the proposed land to be 
irrigated is located. The deed should include the legal description of the land (metes and 
bounds). Please note that the application must be in the name(s) of all landowners as shown 
on the deeds; otherwise, proper consent of the application must be provided pursuant to 
Title 30 Texas Administrative Code (TAC) § 295.32(a)(5). 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



Mr. Michael Hartmann 
Application No. 19-2182D 
June 24, 2025 
Page 2 of 2 
 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service?     tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

3. Remit fees in the amount of $119.38 as described below. Please make check payable to the 
Texas Commission on Environmental Quality or the TCEQ.  

 
Filing Fee (100 – 5,000 acre-feet) $      100.00 
Recording Fee $        12.50 
Notice Fee ($0.94 x 127 WR Holders) $      119.38 
Total Fees $      231.88 
Fees Received $     -112.50 
Fees Due $      119.38 
  

Please provide the requested information and fees by July 24, 2025, or the application may be 
returned pursuant to Title 30 TAC § 281.18. 
 
If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me via e-mail at 
Natalia.Ponebshek@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-4641.    

 
Sincerely, 
 
 
 
Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
 
 



MAR-11-25 02:42 PM
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Basis2 Receipt Report by Endorsement Number

Report_ID:

WUPAcct. #: WATER USE PERMITSAccount Name:
Paid For

M554269

Endors. #

ADJ2182

Ref #2

HARTMANN, MICHAEL 

J/MICHELLE T

Paid In By

CK

PayTyp

3666

Chk # Card#

BS00114254

Bank Slip

21-FEB-25

Tran.Date

 $112.50

Receipt Amnt.
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Natalia Ponebshek

From: Michael Hartmann 
Sent: Wednesday, July 30, 2025 2:26 PM
To: Natalia Ponebshek
Subject: Re: FW: Kalala, Lyssy, Volner App No. 19-2128D RFI

Please accept my request for an extension on the Information request for the Kalala/Lyssy/Volner 
amendment application. I was not aware of the request. 
 
On Tue, Jul 29, 2025 at 2:26 PM Natalia Ponebshek <Natalia.Ponebshek@tceq.texas.gov> wrote: 

Hello Mr. Hartmann, 

  

Please see the attached RFI that was sent on June 24, 2025. Please confirm receipt and request an 
extension. Let me know if you have any questions. 

  

Thank you, 

  

Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager 

Water Rights Permitting Team 

Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 

(512) 239-4641 

  

From: Natalia Ponebshek  
Sent: Tuesday, June 24, 2025 4:04 PM 
To: Michael Hartmann > 
Cc: Chris Kozlowski <Chris.Kozlowski@tceq.texas.gov>; Humberto Galvan <Humberto.Galvan@tceq.texas.gov> 
Subject: Kalala, Lyssy, Volner App No. 19-2128D RFI 

  

Good afternoon, 
  
Please find the attached request for information for the abovementioned application. A response is due 
by July 24, 2025. Please let me know if you have any questions regarding this request. 
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Thank you, 
  
Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
(512) 239-4641 
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Natalia Ponebshek

From: Natalia Ponebshek
Sent: Tuesday, June 24, 2025 4:04 PM
To: Michael Hartmann
Cc: Chris Kozlowski; Humberto Galvan
Subject: Kalala, Lyssy, Volner App No. 19-2128D RFI
Attachments: Kalala_Lyssy_Volner_19-2182D_RFI 1_Sent_6.24.2025.pdf

Good afternoon, 
  
Please find the attached request for information for the abovementioned application. A response is due 
by July 24, 2025. Please let me know if you have any questions regarding this request. 
  
Thank you, 
  
Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
(512) 239-4641 
 



Brooke T. Paup, Chairwoman  

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Catarina R. Gonzales, Commissioner 

Kelly Keel, Executive Director 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service?     tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

June 24, 2025 
 
Mr. Michael Hartmann   VIA E-MAIL 
Authorized Agent 
680 County Road 312 
Floresville, TX 78114-3407 
 
RE: Antoinette Kalala, Duane Lyssy, Maxine F. Lyssy, Sheldon Lyssy, and Wendy L. Volner  

ADJ 2182 
CN606008894, CN606008936, CN606008910, CN606008944, CN606008928, 

RN102640299 
 Application No. 19-2182D to Amend Certificate of Adjudication No. 19-2182 

Texas Water Code (TWC) § 11.122, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice 
San Antonio River, San Antonio River Basin 

 Wilson and Karnes Counties 
 
Dear Mr. Hartmann: 
 
This acknowledges receipt, on January 29, 2025, of the referenced application, and on February 
21, 2025, of fees in the amount of $112.50 (Receipt No. M554269, attached). 
 
Additional information and fees are required before the application can be declared 
administratively complete. 
 
1. Provide information describing how this application addresses a water supply need in a 

manner that is consistent with the state water plan or the applicable approved regional 
water plan (Section 4.a. of the Technical Information Report). Note: For examples, see page 
15 of the Instructions for Completing the Water Right Permitting Application (Form TCEQ-
10214A-inst). 
 

2. Confirm applicants are not requesting to change the place of use for agricultural purposes.  
Staff notes, the current place of use for agricultural purposes is to irrigate within a 37-acre 
tract and being part of a larger 359-acre tract in the Luis Manchaca Grant Survey, Abstract 
No. 18 in Wilson County.  
 
Alternatively, indicate the total acres of land the applicants propose to be irrigated and 
provide a recorded copy of the deed(s) for the property where the proposed land to be 
irrigated is located. The deed should include the legal description of the land (metes and 
bounds). Please note that the application must be in the name(s) of all landowners as shown 
on the deeds; otherwise, proper consent of the application must be provided pursuant to 
Title 30 Texas Administrative Code (TAC) § 295.32(a)(5). 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



Mr. Michael Hartmann 
Application No. 19-2182D 
June 24, 2025 
Page 2 of 2 
 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service?     tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
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3. Remit fees in the amount of $119.38 as described below. Please make check payable to the 
Texas Commission on Environmental Quality or the TCEQ.  

 
Filing Fee (100 – 5,000 acre-feet) $      100.00 
Recording Fee $        12.50 
Notice Fee ($0.94 x 127 WR Holders) $      119.38 
Total Fees $      231.88 
Fees Received $     -112.50 
Fees Due $      119.38 
  

Please provide the requested information and fees by July 24, 2025, or the application may be 
returned pursuant to Title 30 TAC § 281.18. 
 
If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me via e-mail at 
Natalia.Ponebshek@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-4641.    

 
Sincerely, 
 
 
 
Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
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Basis2 Receipt Report by Endorsement Number

Report_ID:

WUPAcct. #: WATER USE PERMITSAccount Name:
Paid For

M554269

Endors. #

ADJ2182

Ref #2

HARTMANN, MICHAEL 

J/MICHELLE T

Paid In By

CK

PayTyp

3666

Chk # Card#

BS00114254

Bank Slip

21-FEB-25

Tran.Date

 $112.50

Receipt Amnt.






























































































