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Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 
 

TO:             Office of the Chief Clerk       
  Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 
 
THRU:          Chris Kozlowski, Team Leader 
  Water Rights Permitting Team   
 
FROM:          Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager 
  Water Rights Permitting Team 
 
DATE:          December 20, 2024 
 
SUBJECT:     MCHR Family Farm, LLC 

ADJ 1253  
CN606268209, RN102720760 
Application No. 14-1253A to Amend a Portion of Certificate of 

Adjudication No. 14-1253 
Texas Water Code § 11.122, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice 
Spring Creek, Colorado River Basin 
Irion County  

 
The application was received on December 2, 2024, additional information was 
received on December 3 and 15, 2024, and fees were received on December 5, 
2024. The application was declared administratively complete and accepted for 
filing with the Office of the Chief Clerk on December 20, 2024. Mailed notice to the 
record holder (co-owners) is required pursuant to 30 Title Texas Administrative 
Code (TAC) § 295.158(c)(2)(B) and to the interjacent water right holders of record 
in the Colorado River Basin pursuant to Title 30 TAC § 295.158(c)(3)(D); however, 
there are no interjacent water right holders.  
 
All fees have been paid and the application is sufficient for filing. 
 
 
 
____________________________ 
Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager  
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

OCC Mailed Notice Required    ☐YES  ☒NO 



Jon Niermann, Chairman 

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Catarina R. Gonzales, Commissioner 

Kelly Keel, Executive Director 

 

 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 
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printed on recycled paper 

 

December 20, 2024 
     
Ms. Becky Bookter  VIA E-MAIL 
MCHR Family Farm, LLC 
2819 Chatterton Dr.  
San Angelo, TX 76904-6155 
 
RE:       MCHR Family Farm, LLC 

ADJ 1253  
CN606268209, RN102720760 
Application No. 14-1253A to Amend a Portion of Certificate of Adjudication No. 14-1253 
Texas Water Code § 11.122, Requiring Limited Mailed Notice 
Spring Creek, Colorado River Basin 
Irion County  

    
Dear Ms. Bookter: 
 
This acknowledges receipt, on December 2, 2024, of the application, on December 3 and 15, 
2024, of additional information, and on December 5, 2024, of fees in the amount of $112.50 
(Receipt No. M547358, copy attached). 
 
The application was declared administratively complete and filed with the Office of the Chief 
Clerk on December 20, 2024. Staff will continue processing the application for consideration by 
the Executive Director.  
 
Please be advised that additional information may be requested during the technical review 
phase of the application process. 
 
If you have any questions concerning the application, please contact me via email at 
Natalia.Ponebshek@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-4641.   
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
 
Natalia Ponebshek, Project Manager  
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
 
Attachment 
 
 
 
 

Type text here
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Natalia Ponebshek

From: becky bookter >
Sent: Sunday, December 15, 2024 12:52 PM
To: Natalia Ponebshek
Subject: MCHR Family Farm LLC Consent
Attachments: Don and Susan Consent for diversion point and use.pdf

attached is the consent from Don and Susan Ball for the new nes diversion point and use 
 
Becky 





 Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 
TELEPHONE MEMO TO THE FIILE 

 
Call to:   

Becky Bookter 

Call from: TECQ Staff  

Natalia Ponebshek 

Date: 

12/13/2024 

Applicant:  (app name and #) 

MCHR Family Farms, LLC App No. 14-1253A 

Information for File follows: 

I called Becky Bookter to discuss getting a signed consent letter from the co-owners on ADJ 14-1253 so that 

no notice will be required for this application. She will obtain the consent letter and email it to me next 

week. 

 

Natalia Ponebshek 12/13/2024 

Signed  

 



DEC-12-24 12:15 PM

Page 1

Basis2 Receipt Report by Endorsement Number

Report_ID:

WUPAcct. #: WATER USE PERMITSAccount Name:
Paid For

M547358

Endors. #

ADJ141253

Ref #2

MCHR FAMILY FARM 

LLC

Paid In By

CK

PayTyp

1010

Chk # Card#

BS00112703

Bank Slip

05-DEC-24

Tran.Date

 $112.50

Receipt Amnt.
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Natalia Ponebshek

From: becky bookter 
Sent: Tuesday, December 3, 2024 2:28 PM
To: Natalia Ponebshek
Subject: MCHR Family Farm LLC
Attachments: Scan 12.3.24.pdf

Here are the three pages.  Thanks 
Becky 










































































































































