
TCEQ Interoffice Memorandum 

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality 

TO:   Office of the Chief Clerk    
Texas Commission on Environmental Quality  

  
THRU:  Chris Kozlowski, Team Leader  

Water Rights Permitting Team  
  
FROM:  Jenna Rollins, Project Manager  

Water Rights Permitting Team  
  
DATE:  March 31, 2022 
  
SUBJECT:  Roger A. Kerbow 
  WRPERM 13337 
  CN605194315, RN109280032 

Application to Abandon Water Use Permit No. 13337 
  Texas Water Code § 5.122, Not Requiring Notice 
  Unnamed tributary of Leon River, Brazos River Basin 
  Comanche County 
 
  
The application was received on December 3, 2021. Fees were received on 
February 14, 2022, and additional information was received on March 25, 2022. 
The application was declared administratively complete and accepted for filing with 
the Office of the Chief Clerk on March 31, 2022. No notice is required pursuant to 
Title 30 Texas Administrative Code § 295.175. 
 
All fees have been paid and the application is sufficient for filing. 
  
  
  
_________________________  
Jenna Rollins, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team 
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
  
 

 

 
  

 
OCC Mailed Notice Required    □YES□NO 



Jon Niermann, Chairman 

Emily Lindley, Commissioner 

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Toby Baker, Executive Director 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

 
March 31, 2022 

            
Mr. Roger A. Kerbow        VIA E-MAIL 
P.O. Box 530735    
Grand Prairie, Texas 75053-0735 
  
RE: Roger A. Kerbow 

WRPERM 13337 
CN605194315, RN109280032 
Application to Abandon Water Use Permit No. 13337 
Texas Water Code § 5.122, Not Requiring Notice 
Unnamed tributary of Leon River, Brazos River Basin 
Comanche County 
  

Dear Mr. Kerbow:    
 
This acknowledges receipt of fees on February 14, 2022, and of additional information on 
March 25, 2022. 
  
The application was declared administratively complete and filed with the Office of the Chief 
Clerk on March 31, 2022. Staff will continue processing the application for consideration by the 
Executive Director.   
  
Please be advised that additional information may be requested during the technical review 
phase of the application process.  
  
If you have any questions concerning the application, please contact me via email at 
jenna.rollins@tceq.texas.gov or by phone at 512-239-1845. 
  
Sincerely,  
  
   
 
Jenna Rollins, Project Manager   
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
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Jenna Rollins

From: Kerbow and Associates <rak.wealthologist@sbcglobal.net>
Sent: Friday, March 25, 2022 9:59 AM
To: Jenna Rollins
Subject: RE: Roger Kerbow - Application to Abandon WRPERM 13337

I have previously responded to you.  We only use the pond for livestock.  We have moved the pump for pivot to another 
pond which we fill with water from wells. 
 
Sent from Mail for Windows 
 

From: Jenna Rollins 
Sent: Thursday, March 24, 2022 4:06 PM 
To: rak.wealthologist@sbcglobal.net 
Subject: Roger Kerbow - Application to Abandon WRPERM 13337 
 
Dear Mr. Kerbow,  
 
We have been trying to reach you in regards to your application to abandon Water Use Permit No. 13337. Please see the 
attached documents and provide a response to question 1 in the Request For Information Letter (RFI), dated January 4, 
2022, or the application may be returned. If you have any questions please let me know.  
 
Thank you, 
Jenna Rollins, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
512-239-1845 
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Jenna Rollins

From: Molly Mohler
Sent: Monday, March 7, 2022 12:11 PM
To: Jenna Rollins
Subject: RE: Roger A. Kerbow WRPERM 13337 Abandonment Application Received 

The fees were received on Feb. 14th.  
 
Molly 
 

From: Jenna Rollins <Jenna.Rollins@tceq.texas.gov>  
Sent: Monday, March 7, 2022 9:59 AM 
To: Molly Mohler <molly.mohler@tceq.texas.gov> 
Subject: RE: Roger A. Kerbow WRPERM 13337 Abandonment Application Received  
 
Good morning,  
 
Does Mr. Kerbow still have an outstanding balance of $84.54 with the WM program? 
 
Best,  
Jenna 
 

From: Molly Mohler <molly.mohler@tceq.texas.gov>  
Sent: Friday, February 4, 2022 8:51 AM 
To: Jenna Rollins <Jenna.Rollins@tceq.texas.gov> 
Subject: RE: Roger A. Kerbow WRPERM 13337 Abandonment Application Received  
 
We still have an outstanding balance of $84.54. 
 

From: Jenna Rollins <Jenna.Rollins@tceq.texas.gov>  
Sent: Thursday, February 3, 2022 2:37 PM 
To: Molly Mohler <molly.mohler@tceq.texas.gov> 
Subject: RE: Roger A. Kerbow WRPERM 13337 Abandonment Application Received  
 
Good afternoon Molly,  
 
Mr. Kerbow was sent an RFI for his outstanding fees with the WM program that has a due date of COB today. Has his 
balance been paid? 
 
Thank you,  
Jenna 
 

From: Molly Mohler <molly.mohler@tceq.texas.gov>  
Sent: Thursday, January 27, 2022 3:16 PM 
To: Jenna Rollins <Jenna.Rollins@tceq.texas.gov> 
Subject: RE: Roger A. Kerbow WRPERM 13337 Abandonment Application Received  
 
It has not been paid. 
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From: Jenna Rollins <Jenna.Rollins@tceq.texas.gov>  
Sent: Thursday, January 27, 2022 3:10 PM 
To: Molly Mohler <molly.mohler@tceq.texas.gov> 
Subject: RE: Roger A. Kerbow WRPERM 13337 Abandonment Application Received  
 
Good afternoon,  
 
Has Mr. Kerbow paid his outstanding balance of $84.54? 
 
Thank you,  
Jenna 
 

From: Molly Mohler <molly.mohler@tceq.texas.gov>  
Sent: Thursday, December 9, 2021 3:02 PM 
To: Jenna Rollins <Jenna.Rollins@tceq.texas.gov> 
Subject: RE: Roger A. Kerbow WRPERM 13337 Abandonment Application Received  
 
Attached is the annual assessment for Roger Kerbow. 
 

From: Jenna Rollins <Jenna.Rollins@tceq.texas.gov>  
Sent: Thursday, December 9, 2021 2:53 PM 
To: Molly Mohler <molly.mohler@tceq.texas.gov> 
Subject: RE: Roger A. Kerbow WRPERM 13337 Abandonment Application Received  
 
Good afternoon,  
 
Can you please send Mr. Kerbow’s WM account number and the month(s) for which the outstanding balance is for? 
 
Thank you,  
Jenna 
 

From: Molly Mohler <molly.mohler@tceq.texas.gov>  
Sent: Tuesday, December 7, 2021 3:14 PM 
To: Jenna Rollins <Jenna.Rollins@tceq.texas.gov> 
Subject: RE: Roger A. Kerbow WRPERM 13337 Abandonment Application Received  
 
Mr. Roger Kerbow has an outstanding balance with the Brazos Watermaster Program of $84.54. 
 
Molly 
 

From: Jenna Rollins <Jenna.Rollins@tceq.texas.gov>  
Sent: Tuesday, December 7, 2021 3:06 PM 
To: Molly Mohler <molly.mohler@tceq.texas.gov> 
Subject: Roger A. Kerbow WRPERM 13337 Abandonment Application Received  
 
Good afternoon,  
 
An abandonment application for Roger A. Kerbow WRPERM 13337 was received on 12/3/21. Does he have any past due 
late fees with the watermaster program? 
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Thank you, 
Jenna Rollins, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 
512-239-1845 
 



Jon Niermann, Chairman 

Emily Lindley, Commissioner 

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Toby Baker, Executive Director 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service? tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

February 7, 2022 
   

Mr. Roger A. Kerbow        CERTIFIED MAIL 
P.O. Box 530735   
Grand Prairie, Texas 75053-0735 
  

RE: Roger A. Kerbow 
WRPERM 13337 
CN605194315, RN109280032 
Application to Abandon Water Use Permit No. 13337 
Texas Water Code § 5.122, No Notice Required 
Unnamed tributary of Leon River, Brazos River Basin 
Comanche County 
  

Dear Mr. Kerbow:  
  
This is a follow up to our previous letter dated January 4, 2022 (copy attached) requesting 
additional information for the referenced application. To date, a response has not been 
received.  
 
Please submit the information requested by March 9, 2022 or the application may be returned 
pursuant to Title 30 Texas Administrative Code § 281.18.   
 
If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me via email at 
jenna.rollins@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-1845.  
 
Sincerely,  
  
 
 
Jenna Rollins, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section  
 

Attachment 

 

http://www.tceq.state.tx.us/


Jon Niermann, Chairman 

Emily Lindley, Commissioner 

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Toby Baker, Executive Director 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service? tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

January 4, 2022 

Mr. Roger A. Kerbow  VIA CERTIFIED MAIL 

P.O. Box 530735 

Grand Prairie, Texas 75053-0735 

RE: Roger A. Kerbow 
WRPERM 13337 
CN605194315, RN109280032 
Application to Abandon Water Use Permit No. 13337 
Texas Water Code § 5.122, No Notice Required 
Unnamed tributary of Leon River, Brazos River Basin 
Comanche County 

Dear Mr. Kerbow:  

This acknowledges receipt, on December 3, 2021, of the referenced application. 

Additional information and fees are required before the application can be declared 
administratively complete.   

1. Confirm that the existing 2.75 acre-foot capacity reservoir will be used solely for domestic,
livestock, or other exempt purposes pursuant to Texas Water Code § 11.142 (copy
attached). Please note that if Water Use Permit No. 13337 is abandoned, use of the reservoir
for any purpose other than domestic, livestock, or other exempt purposes could be a
violation and subject to enforcement.

2. Commission records indicate that as of December 7, 2021, Mr. Roger A. Kerbow has
outstanding fees or penalties in the amount of $84.54 within one or more program areas,
see attachment. Please remit these fees as soon as possible to facilitate the processing of
this application. You may contact Financial Administration at (512) 239-0300 for the latest
outstanding balance and more detailed information on the amount owed.

Please provide the requested information and fees by February 3, 2022, or the application may 
be returned pursuant to Title 30 Texas Administrative Code § 281.18.   

http://www.tceq.state.tx.us/


Mr. Roger A. Kerbow 

Application No. 13337 

January 4, 2022 

Page 2 of 2 

If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me via email at 
jenna.rollins@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-1845. 

Sincerely, 

Jenna Rollins, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 

Attachments 



Sec. 11.142. PERMIT EXEMPTIONS. (a) Without obtaining a permit, a person may 
construct on the person's own property a dam or reservoir with normal storage of not 
more than 200 acre-feet of water for domestic and livestock purposes. A person who 
temporarily stores more than 200 acre-feet of water in a dam or reservoir described by 
this subsection is not required to obtain a permit for the dam or reservoir if the person 
can demonstrate that the person has not stored in the dam or reservoir more than 200 
acre-feet of water on average in any 12-month period. This exemption does not apply 
to a commercial operation. 

Text of subsec. (b) as amended by Acts 2001, 77th Leg., ch. 966, Sec. 2.09 

(b) Without obtaining a permit, a person may construct on the person's property a
dam or reservoir with normal storage of not more than 200 acre-feet of water for fish
and wildlife purposes if the property on which the dam or reservoir will be constructed
is qualified open-space land, as defined by Section 23.51, Tax Code. This exemption
does not apply to a commercial operation.

Text of subsec. (b) as amended by Acts 2001, 77th Leg., ch. 1427, Sec. 1 

(b) Without obtaining a permit, a person may construct on the person's property in an
unincorporated area a dam or reservoir with normal storage of not more than 200
acre-feet of water for commercial or noncommercial wildlife management, including
fishing, but not including fish farming.

(c) Without obtaining a permit, a person who is drilling and producing petroleum and
conducting operations associated with drilling and producing petroleum may take for
those purposes state water from the Gulf of Mexico and adjacent bays and arms of the
Gulf of Mexico in an amount not to exceed one acre-foot during each 24-hour period.

(d) Without obtaining a permit, a person may construct or maintain a reservoir as part
of a surface coal mining operation under Chapter 134, Natural Resources Code, if the
water in the reservoir is used solely for:

(1) sediment control; or

(2) compliance with applicable laws, rules, or regulations relating to fire or dust
suppression.

Amended by Acts 1977, 65th Leg., p. 2207, ch. 870, Sec. 1, eff. Sept. 1, 1977; Acts 
1985, 69th Leg., ch. 718, Sec. 1, eff. June 14, 1985; Acts 1995, 74th Leg., ch. 335, Sec. 
1, eff. Sept. 1, 1995; Acts 1997, 75th Leg., ch. 1010, Sec. 2.11, eff. Sept. 1, 1997; Acts 
2001, 77th Leg., ch. 966, Sec. 2.09, eff. Sept. 1, 2001; Acts 2001, 77th Leg., ch. 1427, 
Sec. 1, eff. Sept. 1, 2001. 

Amended by: 

Acts 2009, 81st Leg., R.S., Ch. 63 (S.B. 1711), Sec. 1, eff. May 19, 2009. 



January 3, 2022 

  
RE: Roger A. Kerbow 

WRPERM 13337 
CN605194315, RN109280032 
Application to Abandon Water Use Permit No. 13337 
Texas Water Code § 5.122, No Notice Required 
Unnamed tributary of Leon River, Brazos River Basin 
Comanche County 
   

The staff of the Texas Commission on Environmental Quality (TCEQ) has determined 
that payment of the following fees and/or penalties by Roger A. Kerbow is required before your 
application to abandon Water Use Permit No. 13337 can be declared administratively complete:  
  

Fees  
The fees owed are Brazos Watermaster Fees in the amount of $84.54 for account No. 
24306241. 

  
Please be advised that failure to pay fees/penalties within 30 days will result in additional 
administrative actions affecting your fee accounts and your application with TCEQ. With 
respect to fees and/or penalties, these actions may include enforcement and collections 
efforts to recover the debt owed to the state.  Regarding your permit applications, additional 
administrative actions may include return of your applications (forfeiting the application 
fees), or a contested case hearing that may result in the denial of your applications.   
  
If you believe that your liability for any portion of the delinquency noted above has been 
discharged in bankruptcy, or if you are presently a debtor in a pending bankruptcy proceeding, 
please immediately furnish the undersigned with file-stamped copies of the following pleadings 
from the bankruptcy court where your bankruptcy case was/is filed: (1) Bankruptcy Petition; (2) 
Schedules and Statement of Affairs; (3) Creditor Matrix/Matrices; and (4) Discharge Order or 
Confirmation Order. Please mail those copies to the TCEQ at P.O. Box 13087, Mail Code 132, 
Austin, TX 78711-3087, and include any additional documents from the bankruptcy court that 
you believe are relevant to your responsibilities for the noted delinquency. We will immediately 
review these pleadings and take appropriate action regarding your permit applications.   
  
Payment may be made through the following methods: cash, check, ACH (electronic check), 
money order, or credit card through TCEQ's electronic payment portal (e-pay). Additional 
information regarding payment options is available 
at https://www.tceq.texas.gov/agency/financial/fees/delin#payment. Upon payment, please 
send documentation reflecting payment of all delinquent fees and penalties to the Brazos 
Watermaster. If you have any questions regarding your application, you may contact Jenna 
Rollins at jenna.rollins@tceq.texas.gov. If you have any questions regarding the delinquencies, 
please use the attached list of fee coordinators for contact information. Please use Mail 
Code 160 when responding by mail.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

https://www.tceq.texas.gov/agency/financial/fees/delin#payment
mailto:jenna.rollins@tceq.texas.gov


 

 

 

TCEQ Program Fee Coordinators    

 

FEE  FEE TYPE  PROGRAM FEE COORD.  

AEF  AIR EMISSIONS FEE  AQPI Division (512) 239-1459  

AST  ABOVEGROUND STORAGE TANKS  PST Registration Team (512) 

239-2160   
BLP  WATERSHED MGMT. BENEF. LAND APPLIC.  Michael Anstice (512) 239-4327  

BWM  BRAZOS WATERMASTER  Molly Mohler (254) 761-3027  

BYP  RADIOACTIVE BY-PRODUCT FEE  Tom Robichaux (512) 239-6455  

CDP  HW COMMERCIAL (COUNTY)  Susie Medrano (512) 239-0517  

CRW  CONCHO RIVER WATERMASTER  Alisha Multer (325) 481-8069  

      

CWQ  CONSOLIDATED WATER QUALITY FEE  WQ Applications Team (512) 

239-4671  
DCR  DRYCLEANING REGISTRATION FEE  Drycleaner Reg. Team (512) 239-

2160  
EIF  AIR INSPECTION FEE  AQPI Division (512) 239-1459  

GPS  GENERAL PERMIT STORMWATER FEE  Stormwater Permit Team (512) 

239-3700 
GPW  GENERAL PERMIT WASTEWATER FEE  Stormwater Permit Team (512) 

239-4671 
HWF  HAZARDOUS WASTE FACILITY  Susie Medrano (512) 239-0517  

HWG  HAZARDOUS WASTE GENERATION  Andi Windham (512) 239-1325  

HWX  HW COMMERCIAL (MGMT. FEES)  Susie Medrano (512) 239-0517  

ILP  INNOCENT LANDOWNER  Jennifer Westerman (512) 239-

4199 
NWF  NONHAZARDOUS WASTE FACILITY  Suisie Medrano (512) 239-0517  

NWG  NONHAZARDOUS WASTE GENERATION  Andi Windham (512) 239-1325  

PHS  PUBLIC HEALTH SERVICE  Public Drinking Water (512) 239-

4691  
RGR  RIO GRANDE WATERMASTER  Jose Davila (830) 773-5059 

RLA  RADIOACTIVE SUBSTANCE LICENSING FEE  Kathryn Ploch (512) 239-6577  

RAF REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE Teri Cisneros (512) 239-6963 

SDP  SURFACE DISPOSAL FEE  Michael Anstice (512) 239-4327  

STX  SOUTH TEXAS WATERMASTER  Alisha Multer (325) 481-8069 

SWD  SOLID WASTE DISPOSAL FACILITIES  Susie Medrano (512) 239-0517  
SWM SOLID WASTE MEDICAL TRANSPORTER FEE Gwinda Casper (512) 239-6814 

 

T2M, 

T2NM, 

T2PE 

TIER II CHEMICAL REPORTING Ann Adams (512) 239-5064 

   

TOX  TOXIC REPORTING FEE  Blake Kidd (512) 239-1441  

   

UST  UNDERGROUND STORAGE TANKS  PST Registration Team (512) 

239-2160   
VCP  VOLUNTARY CLEAN-UP  Jennifer Westerman (512) 239-

4199  
WMB  WATERSHED MGMT. BENEF. LAND USE  ARP Team (512) 239-4671 



 

For invoice copies, or an explanation of late fees and cost recovery fees, please call the Revenue Section at 

(512) 239-5136 or (512) 239-0355.  For an explanation of the fee assessment, please call the Program Fee 

Coordinator listed above for the applicable fee.  

  
  

 

WMS  WATERSHED MGMT. SLUDGE HAULERS  Gwinda Casper (512) 239-6814  

WRU   
WTR  

WU REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEES   
WASTEWATER TRTMT. RESRCH. COUNCIL  

Terri Cisneros (512) 239-6963   
Pamela Ezeani (512) 239-0351 

WUF  WATER USE ASSESSMENT (WTR. RIGHTS)  Rebecca DuPont (512) 239-6329  



Jon Niermann, Chairman 

Emily Lindley, Commissioner 

Bobby Janecka, Commissioner 

Toby Baker, Executive Director 

P.O. Box 13087   •   Austin, Texas 78711-3087   •   512-239-1000   •   tceq.texas.gov 

How is our customer service? tceq.texas.gov/customersurvey 
printed on recycled paper 

TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
Protecting Texas by Reducing and Preventing Pollution 

January 4, 2022 

Mr. Roger A. Kerbow  VIA CERTIFIED MAIL 

P.O. Box 530735 

Grand Prairie, Texas 75053-0735 

RE: Roger A. Kerbow 
WRPERM 13337 
CN605194315, RN109280032 
Application to Abandon Water Use Permit No. 13337 
Texas Water Code § 5.122, No Notice Required 
Unnamed tributary of Leon River, Brazos River Basin 
Comanche County 

Dear Mr. Kerbow:  

This acknowledges receipt, on December 3, 2021, of the referenced application. 

Additional information and fees are required before the application can be declared 
administratively complete.   

1. Confirm that the existing 2.75 acre-foot capacity reservoir will be used solely for domestic,
livestock, or other exempt purposes pursuant to Texas Water Code § 11.142 (copy
attached). Please note that if Water Use Permit No. 13337 is abandoned, use of the reservoir
for any purpose other than domestic, livestock, or other exempt purposes could be a
violation and subject to enforcement.

2. Commission records indicate that as of December 7, 2021, Mr. Roger A. Kerbow has
outstanding fees or penalties in the amount of $84.54 within one or more program areas,
see attachment. Please remit these fees as soon as possible to facilitate the processing of
this application. You may contact Financial Administration at (512) 239-0300 for the latest
outstanding balance and more detailed information on the amount owed.

Please provide the requested information and fees by February 3, 2022, or the application may 
be returned pursuant to Title 30 Texas Administrative Code § 281.18.   

http://www.tceq.state.tx.us/


Mr. Roger A. Kerbow 

Application No. 13337 

January 4, 2022 

Page 2 of 2 

If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me via email at 
jenna.rollins@tceq.texas.gov or by telephone at (512) 239-1845. 

Sincerely, 

Jenna Rollins, Project Manager 
Water Rights Permitting Team  
Water Rights Permitting and Availability Section 

Attachments 



Sec. 11.142. PERMIT EXEMPTIONS. (a) Without obtaining a permit, a person may 
construct on the person's own property a dam or reservoir with normal storage of not 
more than 200 acre-feet of water for domestic and livestock purposes. A person who 
temporarily stores more than 200 acre-feet of water in a dam or reservoir described by 
this subsection is not required to obtain a permit for the dam or reservoir if the person 
can demonstrate that the person has not stored in the dam or reservoir more than 200 
acre-feet of water on average in any 12-month period. This exemption does not apply 
to a commercial operation. 

Text of subsec. (b) as amended by Acts 2001, 77th Leg., ch. 966, Sec. 2.09 

(b) Without obtaining a permit, a person may construct on the person's property a
dam or reservoir with normal storage of not more than 200 acre-feet of water for fish
and wildlife purposes if the property on which the dam or reservoir will be constructed
is qualified open-space land, as defined by Section 23.51, Tax Code. This exemption
does not apply to a commercial operation.

Text of subsec. (b) as amended by Acts 2001, 77th Leg., ch. 1427, Sec. 1 

(b) Without obtaining a permit, a person may construct on the person's property in an
unincorporated area a dam or reservoir with normal storage of not more than 200
acre-feet of water for commercial or noncommercial wildlife management, including
fishing, but not including fish farming.

(c) Without obtaining a permit, a person who is drilling and producing petroleum and
conducting operations associated with drilling and producing petroleum may take for
those purposes state water from the Gulf of Mexico and adjacent bays and arms of the
Gulf of Mexico in an amount not to exceed one acre-foot during each 24-hour period.

(d) Without obtaining a permit, a person may construct or maintain a reservoir as part
of a surface coal mining operation under Chapter 134, Natural Resources Code, if the
water in the reservoir is used solely for:

(1) sediment control; or

(2) compliance with applicable laws, rules, or regulations relating to fire or dust
suppression.

Amended by Acts 1977, 65th Leg., p. 2207, ch. 870, Sec. 1, eff. Sept. 1, 1977; Acts 
1985, 69th Leg., ch. 718, Sec. 1, eff. June 14, 1985; Acts 1995, 74th Leg., ch. 335, Sec. 
1, eff. Sept. 1, 1995; Acts 1997, 75th Leg., ch. 1010, Sec. 2.11, eff. Sept. 1, 1997; Acts 
2001, 77th Leg., ch. 966, Sec. 2.09, eff. Sept. 1, 2001; Acts 2001, 77th Leg., ch. 1427, 
Sec. 1, eff. Sept. 1, 2001. 

Amended by: 

Acts 2009, 81st Leg., R.S., Ch. 63 (S.B. 1711), Sec. 1, eff. May 19, 2009. 



January 3, 2022 

  
RE: Roger A. Kerbow 

WRPERM 13337 
CN605194315, RN109280032 
Application to Abandon Water Use Permit No. 13337 
Texas Water Code § 5.122, No Notice Required 
Unnamed tributary of Leon River, Brazos River Basin 
Comanche County 
   

The staff of the Texas Commission on Environmental Quality (TCEQ) has determined 
that payment of the following fees and/or penalties by Roger A. Kerbow is required before your 
application to abandon Water Use Permit No. 13337 can be declared administratively complete:  
  

Fees  
The fees owed are Brazos Watermaster Fees in the amount of $84.54 for account No. 
24306241. 

  
Please be advised that failure to pay fees/penalties within 30 days will result in additional 
administrative actions affecting your fee accounts and your application with TCEQ. With 
respect to fees and/or penalties, these actions may include enforcement and collections 
efforts to recover the debt owed to the state.  Regarding your permit applications, additional 
administrative actions may include return of your applications (forfeiting the application 
fees), or a contested case hearing that may result in the denial of your applications.   
  
If you believe that your liability for any portion of the delinquency noted above has been 
discharged in bankruptcy, or if you are presently a debtor in a pending bankruptcy proceeding, 
please immediately furnish the undersigned with file-stamped copies of the following pleadings 
from the bankruptcy court where your bankruptcy case was/is filed: (1) Bankruptcy Petition; (2) 
Schedules and Statement of Affairs; (3) Creditor Matrix/Matrices; and (4) Discharge Order or 
Confirmation Order. Please mail those copies to the TCEQ at P.O. Box 13087, Mail Code 132, 
Austin, TX 78711-3087, and include any additional documents from the bankruptcy court that 
you believe are relevant to your responsibilities for the noted delinquency. We will immediately 
review these pleadings and take appropriate action regarding your permit applications.   
  
Payment may be made through the following methods: cash, check, ACH (electronic check), 
money order, or credit card through TCEQ's electronic payment portal (e-pay). Additional 
information regarding payment options is available 
at https://www.tceq.texas.gov/agency/financial/fees/delin#payment. Upon payment, please 
send documentation reflecting payment of all delinquent fees and penalties to the Brazos 
Watermaster. If you have any questions regarding your application, you may contact Jenna 
Rollins at jenna.rollins@tceq.texas.gov. If you have any questions regarding the delinquencies, 
please use the attached list of fee coordinators for contact information. Please use Mail 
Code 160 when responding by mail.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

https://www.tceq.texas.gov/agency/financial/fees/delin#payment
mailto:jenna.rollins@tceq.texas.gov


 

 

 

TCEQ Program Fee Coordinators    

 

FEE  FEE TYPE  PROGRAM FEE COORD.  

AEF  AIR EMISSIONS FEE  AQPI Division (512) 239-1459  

AST  ABOVEGROUND STORAGE TANKS  PST Registration Team (512) 

239-2160   
BLP  WATERSHED MGMT. BENEF. LAND APPLIC.  Michael Anstice (512) 239-4327  

BWM  BRAZOS WATERMASTER  Molly Mohler (254) 761-3027  

BYP  RADIOACTIVE BY-PRODUCT FEE  Tom Robichaux (512) 239-6455  

CDP  HW COMMERCIAL (COUNTY)  Susie Medrano (512) 239-0517  

CRW  CONCHO RIVER WATERMASTER  Alisha Multer (325) 481-8069  

      

CWQ  CONSOLIDATED WATER QUALITY FEE  WQ Applications Team (512) 

239-4671  
DCR  DRYCLEANING REGISTRATION FEE  Drycleaner Reg. Team (512) 239-

2160  
EIF  AIR INSPECTION FEE  AQPI Division (512) 239-1459  

GPS  GENERAL PERMIT STORMWATER FEE  Stormwater Permit Team (512) 

239-3700 
GPW  GENERAL PERMIT WASTEWATER FEE  Stormwater Permit Team (512) 

239-4671 
HWF  HAZARDOUS WASTE FACILITY  Susie Medrano (512) 239-0517  

HWG  HAZARDOUS WASTE GENERATION  Andi Windham (512) 239-1325  

HWX  HW COMMERCIAL (MGMT. FEES)  Susie Medrano (512) 239-0517  

ILP  INNOCENT LANDOWNER  Jennifer Westerman (512) 239-

4199 
NWF  NONHAZARDOUS WASTE FACILITY  Suisie Medrano (512) 239-0517  

NWG  NONHAZARDOUS WASTE GENERATION  Andi Windham (512) 239-1325  

PHS  PUBLIC HEALTH SERVICE  Public Drinking Water (512) 239-

4691  
RGR  RIO GRANDE WATERMASTER  Jose Davila (830) 773-5059 

RLA  RADIOACTIVE SUBSTANCE LICENSING FEE  Kathryn Ploch (512) 239-6577  

RAF REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE Teri Cisneros (512) 239-6963 

SDP  SURFACE DISPOSAL FEE  Michael Anstice (512) 239-4327  

STX  SOUTH TEXAS WATERMASTER  Alisha Multer (325) 481-8069 

SWD  SOLID WASTE DISPOSAL FACILITIES  Susie Medrano (512) 239-0517  
SWM SOLID WASTE MEDICAL TRANSPORTER FEE Gwinda Casper (512) 239-6814 

 

T2M, 

T2NM, 

T2PE 

TIER II CHEMICAL REPORTING Ann Adams (512) 239-5064 

   

TOX  TOXIC REPORTING FEE  Blake Kidd (512) 239-1441  

   

UST  UNDERGROUND STORAGE TANKS  PST Registration Team (512) 

239-2160   
VCP  VOLUNTARY CLEAN-UP  Jennifer Westerman (512) 239-

4199  
WMB  WATERSHED MGMT. BENEF. LAND USE  ARP Team (512) 239-4671 



 

For invoice copies, or an explanation of late fees and cost recovery fees, please call the Revenue Section at 

(512) 239-5136 or (512) 239-0355.  For an explanation of the fee assessment, please call the Program Fee 

Coordinator listed above for the applicable fee.  

  
  

 

WMS  WATERSHED MGMT. SLUDGE HAULERS  Gwinda Casper (512) 239-6814  

WRU   
WTR  

WU REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEES   
WASTEWATER TRTMT. RESRCH. COUNCIL  

Terri Cisneros (512) 239-6963   
Pamela Ezeani (512) 239-0351 

WUF  WATER USE ASSESSMENT (WTR. RIGHTS)  Rebecca DuPont (512) 239-6329  
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