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Response to Preliminary EPA Comments: 

Two Total Maximum Daily Loads for Indicator Bacteria in Big Creek 

Tracking 
Number 

Date 
Received 

Affiliation of 
Commenter 

Summary of Request or 
Comment 

Summary of TCEQ Action,  
or Explanation 

001 01/05/2024 Jonathan 
Jimenez, EPA 

EPA requested that Table 
21 be updated with the 
correct Margin of Safety 
(MOS) value of 160.140 for 
AU 1202J_01. EPA also 
requested to correct Table 
10 since it is incorrectly 
listed as Table 90.  

TCEQ acknowledges the 
comments from EPA and 
concurs with the need for 
correction of these typos.  
 
TCEQ reviewed the TMDL 
and confirmed that the 
incorrect MOS originally listed 
in Table 21 was a typo and 
did not affect the overall 
TMDL calculations.  
Appropriate edits have been 
made to the TMDL document 
based on these comments. 

 


